

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE 11TH
JUDICIAL CIRCUIT IN AND FOR
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

COMPLEX BUSINESS LITIGATION
DIVISION

In re:

CRYSTAL CRUISES LLC, a California
limited liability company,

Case No. 2022-002742-CA-01
Lead Case

CRYSTAL HOLDINGS U.S., LLC, a
Delaware limited liability company,

Case No. 2022-002757-CA-01

CRYSTAL AIRCRUISES, LLC, a Florida
limited liability company, and

Case No. 2022-002758-CA-01

Assignors,
To:

(Jointly Administered Cases)

MARK C. HEALY,

Assignee.

**MOTION FOR APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF FEES AND
REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED BY BERGER
SINGERMAN LLP, AS COUNSEL TO THE ASSIGNEE FOR THE
PERIOD OF OCTOBER 1, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025**

**NOTICE OF OPPORTUNITY TO OBJECT
TO CREDITORS AND OTHER INTERESTED PARTIES:**

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that, pursuant to Fla Stat. § 727.111(4), the Assignee may pay the fees and expenses of professional persons employed by the Assignee as set forth herein, and the Court may consider these actions without further notice or hearing unless a party in interest files an objection within 21 days from the date this paper is served. If you object to the relief requested in this paper, you must file your objection with the Miami-Dade County Clerk of the Court at 73 WFlagler Street, Room 133, Miami, FL 33130, and serve a copy on the Assignee's counsel, Paul Steven Singerman, Esq. and Samuel Jason Capuano, Esq., Berger Singerman LLP, 1450 Brickell Avenue, Suite 1900, Miami, FL 33131, and any other appropriate person. If you do not file an objection within the time permitted, the Assignee and the Court will presume that you do not oppose the granting of the relief requested in the paper.

BERGER SINGERMAN LLP (“Applicant”), pursuant to Florida Statutes §§ 727.102, 727.109(1), (10) and (15), and § 727.111(4), and the Court’s *Order Granting Assignee’s Motion for Entry of an Order: (1) Approving Noticing Procedures, (2) Approving Proof of Claim Forms; and (3) Extending Deadline to Serve Notice of Assignment* (the “Notice Procedures Order”) entered on March 3, 2022, files this motion (the “Motion”) for approval and payment of fees in the amount of \$462,186.50 and reimbursement of expenses incurred in the amount of \$17,407.98 for a total award of \$479,594.48 in connection with its representation of Mark C. Healy (“Assignee”), in his capacity as the Assignee for the benefit of creditors of Crystal Cruises LLC (“Crystal Cruises”), Crystal Holdings U.S. LLC (“Crystal Holdings”), and Crystal Aircruises LLC (“Crystal Aircruises”, and, together with Crystal Cruises and Crystal Holdings, collectively, the “Assignors”) during the period of October 1, 2024 through April 30, 2025 (the “Application Period”). In support of the Motion, the Applicant states:

1. On February 10, 2022, the Assignor executed and delivered, and the Assignee accepted, irrevocable assignments for the benefit of creditors to the Assignee (collectively, the “Assignments”). On February 11, 2022 (the “Petition Date”), a *Petition Commencing Assignment for the Benefit of Creditors* was filed by the Assignee for each of the Assignors, thereby commencing the following assignment for the benefit of creditors cases pursuant to Section 727 of the Florida Statutes, in this Court: *In re Crystal Cruises LLC*, Case No. 2022-002742-CA-01, *In re Crystal Holdings U.S. LLC*, Case No. 2022-002757-CA-01, and *In re Crystal Aircruises LLC*, Case No. 2022-002758-CA-01 (collectively, the “Assignment Cases”).

2. Prior to the Petition Date, the Assignors were engaged in the travel and entertainment business, including operating ocean, river, and expedition cruises and conducting related activities around the world.

3. Pursuant to Florida Statutes § 727.108(7), the Applicant was retained as co-counsel, along with Nardella & Nardella, by the Assignee to perform all legal activities required for the benefit of the estates.

4. On March 3, 2022, the Court entered an order approving the employment of Applicant as counsel to the Assignee *nunc pro tunc* to February 16, 2022.

5. During the Application Period, the Applicant spent significant time reviewing documents and preparing analyses in response to the claims filed in an amount in excess of \$1 billion by the liquidators of the Assignors' parent company, Genting Hong Kong ("Genting") and certain of its subsidiaries, and thereafter in the preparation and prosecution of the Assignee's *Omnibus Objection to Claims of Genting Hong Kong Limited and Certain of Its Subsidiaries* [DE 805] (the "Objection"). In connection with the Objection, the Applicant worked extensively on preparing, finalizing and filing the Assignee's *Motion for Scheduling Order on its Omnibus Objection to Claims* [DE 809] (the "Scheduling Order Motion") filed on January 24, 2025. As a result of the filing of the Scheduling Order Motion and negotiations between the parties at a hearing, the Court entered the *Joint Scheduling Order Concerning Assignee's Omnibus Objection to Claims* [DE 828] scheduling a final hearing on the Objection. The Applicant has spent meaningful time and effort on the voluminous discovery associated with the Objection including regular meet-and-confer sessions with counsel for Genting. The resolution of the Objection is critical to the Assignee's ability to make a distribution on the remaining allowed claims in these cases.

6. During the Application Period, the Applicant also continued with the review and analysis of a significant number of documents related to several remaining significant claims, *e.g.*, Hellman Worldwide Logistics, Inc., Allianz, American Express, and various personal injury

claimants in an effort to eliminate the need to litigate claim objections. The Applicant conducted numerous conferences with the Assignee and counsel for these claimants..

7. During the Application Period, the Applicant also spent a significant amount of time in connection with the hundreds of unclaimed distributions of consumer claimants. This included the preparation, finalizing and filing of the Assignee's *Motion for Entry of an Order Disallowing Claims with Unclaimed Distributions* [DE 829] (the "Unclaimed Distributions Motion") on February 28, 2025. The Applicant prepared for and attended a hearing on the Unclaimed Distributions Motion wherein the Court entered the *Order Granting Assignee's Motion for Entry of Order Disallowing Claims with Unclaimed Distributions* [DE 839] on April 7, 2025.

8. During the Application Period, the Applicant prepared for and attended various interim Case Management Conferences to keep the Court apprised of the status of these Assignment Cases.

9. During the Application Period, Applicant also provided additional reasonable and necessary services to the Assignment estates including, without limitation, the following:

(a) worked on various pleadings and prepared for and attended related hearings held during the course of these Assignment Cases;

(b) assisted with evaluating the assets of the estates, including potential claims against third parties;

(c) prepared for and attended status calls with the Assignee on a frequent basis with his team to discuss all matters affecting the administration of the Assignors' estates;

(d) reviewed documentation received from creditors, responded to inquiries from creditors, and communicated regularly with Assignee's team regarding same;

(e) engaged in discussions with various creditors and governmental agencies regarding claims and other issues; and

(f) prepared and filed motions for approval of payment of the fees of the Assignee and his professionals, attended the related hearing, and prepared orders granting such motions.

10. As of May 19, 2025, the cash balance in the estates is \$67,274,202.18 (the “Estate Funds”).

11. The Applicant, as counsel to the Assignee, has incurred fees in the amount of \$462,186.50 for legal services provided to the Assignee during the Application Period as identified in the chart below and expenses in the amount of \$17,407.98 (for a total of \$479,594.48) in the nature of court reporter fees, photocopy charges, e-discovery storage fees, and other expenses. Applicant’s invoice is attached hereto as **Exhibit “A”**. The summary of the fees and expenses incurred are as follows:

SUMMARY OF FEES OF PROFESSIONALS

Partners/Associates & Paraprofessionals	Hours	Rate	Total
Ilyse M. Homer (2025)	103.40	\$810.00	\$83,754.00
Ilyse M. Homer (2024)	80.00	\$725.00	\$58,000.00
Kenneth W. Waterway (2025)	31.50	\$785.00	\$24,727.50
Kenneth W. Waterway (2024)	2.70	\$725.00	\$1,957.50
Paul Avron	27.90	\$715.00	\$19,948.50
Samuel J. Capuano (2025)	133.10	\$700.00	\$93,170.00
Samuel J. Capuano (2024)	68.20	\$635.00	\$43,307.00
Hunter J. Grasso	114.60	\$525.00	\$60,165.00
Jennifer Schein	100.20	\$600.00	\$60,120.00
Jesse Richman	1.30	\$465.00	\$604.50

Partners/Associates & Paraprofessionals	Hours	Rate	Total
Mary Joann Hill	1.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Carmen Cruz (2025)	20.30	\$425.00	\$8,627.50
Carmen Cruz (2024)	7.80	\$325.00	\$2,535.00
Janette Diaz (2025)	.70	\$425.00	\$297.50
Janette Diaz (2024)	15.30	\$325.00	\$4,972.50
TOTALS	708.50		\$462,186.50

SUMMARY OF EXPENSES INCURRED

Type of Expense	Amount of Expense
Hearing Transcripts	\$313.20
E-Discovery Data Storage Fee (\$12 per GB)	\$15,132.00
Reproductions/Photocopies	\$12.60
Westlaw	\$1,950.18
Total Expenses	\$17,407.98

12. Given the nature of these proceedings, and the amount of work that went into representing the Assignee during the Application Period, the Applicant respectfully requests that the Court approve this Application and allow the Applicant an award of fees in the amount of \$462,186.50 and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$17,407.98, for a total of \$479,594.48 for the period of October 1, 2024 through April 30, 2025.

WEREFOR , the Assignee respectfully requests that this Court enter an Order, in the form attached hereto as **Exhibit “B”**, (i) granting the Motion; (ii) approving the Applicant’s request for compensation for services rendered in the amount of \$462,186.50 and reimbursement of expenses incurred in the amount of \$17,407.98, (iii) authorizing the Assignee to pay the Applicant the sum of \$479,594.48 representing the fees and expenses awarded; and (iv) granting such other and further relief as the Court deems just and proper.

Dated: May 22, 2025

BERGER SINGERMAN LLP
Co-Counsel for Assignee
1450 Brickell Avenue, Suite 1900
Miami, FL 33131
Telephone: (305) 755-9500

By: /s/ Samuel J. Capuano
Paul Steven Singerman
Florida Bar No. 378860
singerman@bergersingerman.com
Samuel J. Capuano
Florida Bar No. 90946
scapuano@bergersingerman.com

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I HEREBY CERTIFY a true and correct copy of the foregoing was served via the Florida Court's e-Filing Portal on May 22, 2025 to all parties that have entered an appearance in this case; on counsel for the Assignors, Adam Losey, Esq., Losey PLLC, 1420 Edgewater Drive, Orlando, FL 32804, via email to alosey@losey.law; via email to cbl44@jud11.flcourts.org pursuant to CBL Rule 2.2; and via e-mail to all creditors and interested parties on the e-mail service list pursuant to the Notice Procedures Order.

By: /s/ Samuel J. Capuano
Samuel J. Capuano

EXHIBIT A
(Invoices)

 **BERGER SINGERMAN**

201 E. LAS OLAS BLVD. SUITE 1500
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301
T: (954) 525-9900 F: (954) 523-2872
WWW.BERGERSINGERMAN.COM
EIN# 45-3121429

MARK C. HEALY, IN HIS CAPACITY AS ASSIGNEE
FOR THE BENEFIT OF CREDITORS OF CRYSTAL
CRUISES, LLC
841 PRUDENTIAL DRIVE
JACKSONVILLE, FL 32207

May 12, 2025
Invoice: 292692

Client: 30806-0001

Re: ***REPRESENTATION OF ASSIGNEE FOR THE BENEFIT
OF CREDITORS OF CRYSTAL CRUISES LLC***

For professional services rendered thru: *April 30, 2025*

Total Fees	462,186.50
Total Expenses	17,407.98
Total Balance Due	\$479,594.48

As always, it is our pleasure to work with you! Payment is due upon receipt.

Payments Options:

You may remit payment via check or visit www.bergersingerman.com/info/client-tools/ to pay by eCheck or credit card.

If you wish to remit payment via wire transfer, please refer to the instructions below.

Thank you!

Wiring instructions for Berger Singerman:

Bank:	City National Bank of Florida
Bank Address:	25 W Flagler Street Miami, FL 33130
ABA No.:	066004367
Account Name:	Berger Singerman, LLP Merchant Account
Account No.:	1955119739
Reference Number:	30806-0001



MARK C. HEALY, IN HIS CAPACITY AS
ASSIGNEE FOR THE BENEFIT OF CREDITORS OF
CRYSTAL CRUISES, LLC
841 PRUDENTIAL DRIVE
JACKSONVILLE, FL 32207

INVOICE DATE: May 12, 2025
INVOICE NO. 292692

REPRESENTATION OF ASSIGNEE FOR THE BENEFIT OF
CREDITORS OF CRYSTAL CRUISES LLC

MATTER ID: 30806-0001

PROFESSIONAL LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: April 30, 2025

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
10/01/24	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING STATUS OF OPEN CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND WORK ON POTENTIAL RESOLUTION OF SAME (1.8); REVIEW SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS FOR PROFESSIONALS' FEE APPLICATIONS (.8); REVIEW AND REVISE WORKING TEAM TASK LIST (.3);	2.90
10/01/24	CC	REVIEW WIP FOR BSLLP FEE APPLICATION.	0.80
10/01/24	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEET AND CONFER REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMS AND PRODUCE RELATED PHOTOS, AND CIRCULATE MEMO TO ASSIGNEE AND COCOUNSEL REGARDING SAME (1.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.2)	2.10
10/01/24	JMS	FURTHER DOC REVIEW (+1000 DOCUMENTS) [REDACTED]	6.80
10/02/24	PA	DOCUMENT REVIEW [REDACTED]	2.40
10/02/24	CC	WORK ON MOTION FOR APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES OF BSLLP.	0.80
10/02/24	SJC	[REDACTED] .2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.2)	0.40
10/03/24	IMH	EMAILS RELATED TO [REDACTED] (.2); ATTN TO OPEN ISSUES	0.60

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		RELATED TO SAME (.4);	
10/03/24	PA	DOCUMENT REVIEW RE [REDACTED]	6.40
10/03/24	PA	MEMOS W/S. CAPUANO RE DOCUMENT IN REVIEW [REDACTED]	0.10
10/03/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING DISCOVERY MATTERS (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING STATUS (.2).	0.60
10/04/24	IMH	COMMUNICATE WITH CREDITORS REGARDING STATUS OF POTENTIAL DISTRIBUTION AND CLAIM OBJECTIONS	0.40
10/04/24	PA	DOCUMENT REVIEW RE [REDACTED]	2.20
10/04/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30
10/05/24	PA	DOCUMENT REVIEW RE [REDACTED]	1.40
10/05/24	PA	DOCUMENT REVIEW RE [REDACTED]	1.20
10/06/24	PA	DOCUMENT REVIEW RE [REDACTED]	1.90
10/07/24	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING STATUS OF REVIEW [REDACTED] (.2); UNDERTAKE SECOND TIER REVIEW OF BATCHES OF DOCUMENTS REVIEWED AND TAGGED (1.8);	2.00
10/07/24	CC	WORK ON MOTION TO APPROVE PAYMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES OF BERGER SINGERMANN LLP.	0.50
10/08/24	JD	REVIEW SUMMARY OF FEES AND EXPENSES; WORK ON MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF FEES AND EXPENSES INCURRED BY BERGER SINGERMANN FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2024 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2024	2.50
10/08/24	IMH	REVISE FILINGS RELATED TO FEE APPLICATIONS FOR ASSIGNEE'S PROFESSIONAL (.4); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (1.5)	1.60
10/08/24	PA	DOCUMENT REVIEW RE [REDACTED]	5.80
10/08/24	SJC	REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH [REDACTED] AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME	0.60
10/09/24	IMH	PREPARE FOR NEXT CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.3); WORK WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW TEAM TO ANALYZE DOCUMENTS [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (1.8)	2.10

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
10/09/24	PA	DOCUMENT REVIEW RE [REDACTED] (1.7) AND MEMOS TO SAM CAPUANO RE SAME (.40)	2.10
10/09/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM [REDACTED] (.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATION (.2)	0.90
10/09/24	JMS	DOCUMENT REVIEW [REDACTED]	5.00
10/10/24	IMH	CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW (1.2); PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH GENTING'S COUNSEL TO DISCUSS STATUS AND POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT (.6); REVISE SUBMISSIONS FOR ASSIGNEE'S PROFESSIONALS TO GET PAID (.2); TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING 10/17 CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.2);	2.20
10/10/24	CC	WORK ON MOTION TO APPROVE PAYMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES OF BERGER SINGERMANN LLP AND PREPARE CORRESPONDING PROPOSED FORM OF ORDER.	0.80
10/10/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND NARDELLA TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.2); [REDACTED] (.3)	0.50
10/10/24	JMS	DOCUMENT REVIEW [REDACTED]	6.50
10/11/24	IMH	PREPARE FOR (.3); AND PARTICIPATE (.7) IN TEAM CALL [REDACTED]; ATTN TO DELIVERABLES FOLLOWING SAME (.6); ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO DOCUMENT REVIEW (.5);	2.10
10/11/24	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE [REDACTED], AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (1.3); COMMUNICATION WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATION (.1)	1.40
10/11/24	JMS	CONFERENCE CALL WITH GENTING COUNSEL RE SETTLEMENT (.8); FURTHER DOCUMENT REVIEW [REDACTED] (3.6)	4.40
10/13/24	IMH	PREPARE FOR TOMORROW'S HANDS ON CALL WITH ASSIGNEE	0.30
10/14/24	IMH	PREPARE FOR CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.3); PARTICIPATE IN HANDS ON CALL WITH ASSIGNEE AND PROFESSIONALS (.5); ATTN TO FOLLOW UP ISSUES (.3); [REDACTED]	2.80

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		██████████ (1.7);	
10/14/24	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH ASSIGNEE, COCOUNSEL, AND TEAM REGARDING VARIOUS REMAINING CLAIM OBJECTION ISSUES, HELLMANN, PI CLAIMS, ██████████, AND OTHER CASE MATTERS, AND CONFERENCES WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR HELLMANN REGARDING SETTLEMENT (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLAIMANT REGARDING CHANGE OF ADDRESS AND REVIEW DOCUMENTATION REGARDING DEATH AND ESTATE ISSUES, AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (.5)	2.80
10/15/24	IMH	PREPARE COUNTER OFFER TO HELLMAN RELATED TO ITS CLAIM (.3); REVISE SUBMISSIONS FOR PROFESSIONAL FEES AND TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING TIMING FOR PAYMENT OF SAME (.3); REVIEW MATERIALS RELATED TO THURSDAY'S CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.4);	1.00
10/15/24	CC	FINALIZE AND E-FILE MOTIONS TO APPROVE PAYMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES OF BERGER SINGERMAN LLP, NARDELLA & NARDELLA AND ASTREA.	1.20
10/16/24	IMH	REVIEW CLAIMS ANALYSIS AND UPDATE FOR STATUS HEARING (1.4)	1.40
10/16/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING HELLMANN COUNTER OFFER (.1); REVIEW FILED FEE APPLICATIONS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.2)	0.30
10/17/24	IMH	TEAM EMAILS REGARDING NEED FOR AMENDED FEE APPLICATION FOR BEGLIAN FIRM (.2); FOLLOW UP WITH NARDELLA TEAM TO DISCUSS STATUS (.2); REVISE ORDER APPROVING PROFESSIONAL FEE APP (.2); TEAM EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS REGARDING TODAY'S CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.2); CALL WITH K COOPER REGARDING STATUS OF SAME (.1)	0.90
10/17/24	SJC	PREPARE FOR CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM ██████████ (1.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COCOUNSEL REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.4)	1.60
10/21/24	PA	DOCUMENT REVIEW RE ██████████	4.40

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		[REDACTED] (1.3);	
10/30/24	IMH	EMAILS REGARDING PBGC CLAIMS (.2);	0.20
10/30/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR PBGC REGARDING STATUS OF CASE (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING GENTING DISCOVERY (.2)	0.40
10/31/24	IMH	ATTN TO OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO DOCUMENT REVIEW [REDACTED]	2.00
10/31/24	SJC	CONFERENCE CALL WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING PI CLAIMS [REDACTED] AS WELL AS OTHER CASE MATTERS (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH PI CONSULTANT REGARDING STATUS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND TEAM REGARDING STATUS AND DISCOVERY (.4)	0.90
11/01/24	IMH	REVIEW DOCKET REGARDING OPEN MATTERS AND PREPARE ORDERS RELATED TO SAME	1.20
11/01/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING CLAIMS AND STATUS	0.20
11/02/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING NEGOTIATIONS AND DISCOVERY ISSUES (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATION ISSUES (.2)	0.60
11/04/24	IMH	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE [REDACTED] (.6); FOLLOW UP WITH COURT REGARDING SUBMISSION OF ORDERS RELATED TO PENDING PROFESSIONAL FEES (.3)	0.90
11/06/24	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING STATUS OF OPEN ISSUES [REDACTED] (.3); [REDACTED] (.8)	1.10
11/06/24	SJC	REVIEW, FINALIZE, AND SUBMIT ORDERS ON SEVERAL FEE APPLICATIONS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM AND BSLLP TEAM REGARDING CONSUMER CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.1)	0.40
11/07/24	IMH	REVISE WORKING TEAM TASK LIST (.2); TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING MONDAY'S HANDS ON CALL WITH ASSIGNEE (.2); ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO MONEYSHOW'S CLAIM (.2)	0.60
11/07/24	CC	FINALIZE AND UPLOADS ORDERS SUSTAINING 47TH, 48TH, 49TH, 50TH, 51ST AND 52ND OBJECTIONS TO	1.40

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		CLAIMS.	
11/07/24	CC	PREPARE, FINALIZE AND E-FILE SECOND NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL OF CERTAIN OBJECTIONS TO CONSUMER CLAIMS.	0.30
11/07/24	CC	PREPARE, FINALIZE AND E-FILE FIFTY-THIRD OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO CONSUMER CLAIMS AND ARRANGE FOR SERVICE OF SAME.	0.30
11/07/24	SJC	CONFERENCE CALL AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR MONEYSHOW REGARDING STATUS AND CLAIMS (.3); REVIEW AND FILE 53RD OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO CLAIMS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW AND SUBMIT 6 ORDERS ON PRIOR OBJECTIONS TO CONSUMER CLAIMS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SAME (.8); REVIEW AND FILE NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL OF CERTAIN OBJECTIONS TO CLAIMS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR ALLIANZ REGARDING STATUS AND CLAIMS (.2)	1.90
11/08/24	CC	FINALIZE AND E-FILE ASSIGNEE'S SECOND NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL OF CERTAIN CONSUMER CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND FIFTY-THIRD OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO CLAIMS.	0.40
11/11/24	IMH	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN HANDS ON CALL WITH ASSIGNEE AND PROFESSIONALS (.7); ATTN TO FOLLOW UP MATTERS RELATED TO PENDING CLAIMS (.8); WORK WITH NARDELLA'S OFFICE ON GLOBAL CLAIMS CHART (.5)	2.00
11/11/24	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND RECURRING CONFERENCE CALL WITH ASSIGNEE, TEAM AND COCOUNSEL REGARDING CLAIMS AND OTHER CASE ISSUES (.8); COMMUNICATIONS WITH PI CONSULTANT REGARDING STATUS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR HELLMANN REGARDING SETTLEMENT (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLAIMANT REGARDING STATUS AND CLAIMS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COCOUNSEL REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING RELATED PARTY CLAIMS AND REVIEW DOCUMENTATION REGARDING SAME (.6); REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH GENTING DISPUTE (.7)	2.90
11/12/24	IMH	PREPARE MOTION AND ORDER FOR HELLMAN SETTLEMENT AND COMMUNICATE WITH COUNSEL REGARDING STATUS OF CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND	2.00

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		POTENTIAL DISTRIBUTION	
11/12/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR PI CLAIMANTS REGARDING DEMANDS, DISCOVERY, AND RELATED MATTERS (.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR HELLMANN AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING SETTLEMENT AND CASE STATUS (.8)	1.30
11/13/24	IMH	FOLLOW UP WITH COURT REGARDING FEE ORDERS (.2); PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMANTS TO DISCUSS SETTLEMENT (.9); REVIEW [REDACTED] (.9)	2.00
11/13/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH HELLMANN COUNSEL REGARDING SETTLEMENT (.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.1)	0.20
11/14/24	IMH	[REDACTED] (.3); PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (1.2); REVIEW RECENT CORRESPONDENCE RELATED TO PENDING PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMS AND DISCUSS RESOLUTION OF SAME (.9); RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS [REDACTED] (1.1)	3.50
11/14/24	SJC	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING DISPUTE [REDACTED] (1.5); REVIEW DOCUMENTS [REDACTED] (1.0); MEETINGS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM [REDACTED] (.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COCOUNSEL AND TEAM REGARDING PENDING OBJECTION AND FEE ORDERS AND HEARING ON CLAIM OBJECTION (.3)	3.70
11/14/24	JMS	MEET WITH I. HOMER RE STATUS OF DISCOVERY (.2); MEET WITH S. CAPUANO RE STRATEGY AND MOTION PRACTICE (.2); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM PILLSBURY (.7); REVIEW AND REVISIONS TO CORRESPONDENCE [REDACTED]	5.20

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		[REDACTED] (1.1)	
11/15/24	IMH	ATTN TO OPEN ISSUES AND INQUIRIES OF TEAM MEMBERS [REDACTED] (1.1); REVIEW AND REVISE [REDACTED] (3); CALL WITH K WATERWAY [REDACTED] (2);	1.60
11/15/24	SJC	RESEARCH AND DRAFT [REDACTED] (2.3); [REDACTED] (8)	3.10
11/15/24	JMS	REVIEW [REDACTED] (1.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. CAPUANO ON SAME (3); [REDACTED] (2.1)	3.60
11/16/24	IMH	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE [REDACTED] (2); TEAM COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING ORDERS ON PENDING CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING RESOLUTION OF SAME (3)	0.50
11/17/24	IMH	[REDACTED] (6); [REDACTED] (9)	1.50
11/18/24	IMH	WORK ON [REDACTED] (2.2); [REDACTED] (3);	2.50
11/18/24	KW	[REDACTED]	0.40
11/18/24	SJC	CONFERENCE CALLS, MEETINGS, AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM [REDACTED] (1.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ESI TEAM [REDACTED] (6)	2.30

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
11/18/24	JMS	MEEETING WITH S. CAPUANO RE MOTION PRACTICE AND DISCOVERY (.3); REVIEW OF DISCOVERY [REDACTED] (.9)	1.20
11/19/24	IMH	PREPARE PROPOSED [REDACTED] (1.8); VISIT WITH ESI TEAM REGARDING OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO PENDING DISCOVERY (.3); FOLLOW UP WITH CLERK'S OFFICE REGARDING PENDING ORDERS (.2)	2.30
11/19/24	SJC	REVIEW FEE ORDERS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE, COCOUNSEL AND TEAM REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW ORDERS ON SEVERAL CONSUMER OBJECTIONS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE [REDACTED] (.2)	0.60
11/19/24	JMS	RECEIPT AND BEGIN REVIEW [REDACTED]	2.60
11/20/24	IMH	[REDACTED]	2.10
11/20/24	JMS	[REDACTED] (2.8); [REDACTED] (2.1)	4.90
11/21/24	IMH	[REDACTED]	0.90
11/21/24	SJC	REVIEW DOCUMENTS [REDACTED] (1.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH ASSIGNEE [REDACTED] (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM AND TEAM REGARDING FEE ORDERS (.2)	2.30
11/21/24	JMS	ADDITIONAL DOCUMENT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS IN LIGHT OF RESEARCH	4.50
11/22/24	IMH	ANALYSIS [REDACTED]	1.20
11/22/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS [REDACTED]	0.20
11/22/24	JMS	[REDACTED]	4.00

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
11/25/24	IMH	ANALYSIS [REDACTED]	1.40
11/25/24	SJC	[REDACTED] (1.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING DISCOVERY MATTERS (.3);	1.90
11/25/24	JMS	PREPARE MEMO [REDACTED]	4.20
11/26/24	IMH	ATTN TO PENDING DISCOVERY ISSUES RELATED TO CLAIM OBJECTIONS	0.80
11/26/24	SJC	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM [REDACTED]	0.30
11/26/24	JMS	[REDACTED]	3.80
11/27/24	SJC	[REDACTED]	2.20
12/02/24	IMH	[REDACTED]	0.40
12/03/24	IMH	REVIEW WORKING TEAM TASK LIST (.2); STRATEGIZE REGARDING OPEN ISSUES [REDACTED] (.3);	0.50
12/03/24	KW	INITIALLY REVIEW AND ASSESS [REDACTED]	0.30
12/03/24	SJC	CONTINUE REVISING [REDACTED]	3.80
12/03/24	JMS	REVIEW AND REVISE [REDACTED] (2.0); [REDACTED] (3.0)	5.00
12/04/24	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS AND EMAILS [REDACTED]	0.40
12/04/24	JMS	EMAILS AND MEMO ON [REDACTED]	3.00
12/05/24	CC	ASSEMBLE AND REVIEW ENTERED ORDERS SUSTAINING OBJECTIONS TO CLAIMS FOR 47TH, 48TH, 49TH, 50TH, 51ST AND 52ND OBJECTIONS TO CONSUMER CLAIMS FOR SERVICE ON CLAIMANTS.	0.30

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
12/06/24	IMH	PREPARE FOR NEXT WEEK'S ALL HANDS ON CALL WITH ASSIGNEE AND PROFESSIONALS	0.30
12/06/24	SJC	REVIEW [REDACTED]	2.20
12/06/24	JMS	REVIEW, [REDACTED] (4.0) AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. CAPUANO ON SAME (.1)	4.10
12/09/24	IMH	PREPARE FOR (.2); AND PARTICIPATE (.6) IN HANDS ON CALL WITH ASSIGNEE AND PROFESSIONALS; ATTN TO FOLLOW UP ITEMS RELATED TO CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.4); REVIEW MONTHLY PROFESSIONAL FEE INVOICES (.4); STRATEGIZE REGARDING UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTIONS AND ANALOGY TO CLAIMS FILED HERE (.3);	1.90
12/09/24	SJC	VARIOUS CONFERENCE CALLS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM [REDACTED] (1.2); [REDACTED] (.2); PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING VARIOUS ISSUES INCLUDING CLAIMS AND AMEX RECOVERY (1.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING OBJECTION TO CLAIMS REGARDING INABILITY TO MAKE DISTRIBUTIONS AND REVIEW SPREADSHEET (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING CLAIM OBJECTION FORM CONSUMER (.2)	3.40
12/10/24	IMH	WORK ON OBJECTION TO REMAINING "UNCLAIMED" CONSUMER PRIORITY CLAIMS INCLUDING RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS OF NOTICE PROVISIONS RELATED TO SAME (2.2); TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING SAME (.3)	2.50
12/10/24	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEET AND CONFER WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING, [REDACTED] (1.8); [REDACTED] (.8); [REDACTED] (.8)	3.40
12/11/24	IMH	TEAM CALLS [REDACTED]	0.40
12/11/24	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND FURTHER CONFERENCE	0.50

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING	
12/12/24	JD	REVIEW [REDACTED]	3.00
12/12/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM [REDACTED]	0.30
12/13/24	JD	REVIEW DOCUMENTS [REDACTED]	2.00
12/13/24	IMH	ANALYSIS RELATED TO MATERIALS [REDACTED]	0.90
12/13/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM [REDACTED]	0.20
12/15/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS [REDACTED]	0.20
12/16/24	JD	REVIEW DOCUMENTS [REDACTED]	3.50
12/16/24	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES REGARDING DALGIC CLAIM (.2); [REDACTED] (.2); [REDACTED] (.3);	0.70
12/16/24	SJC	[REDACTED] (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE [REDACTED] (.2)	0.40
12/17/24	JD	REVIEW [REDACTED]	2.60
12/17/24	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS AND EMAILS REGARDING PREPARATION FOR ALL HANDS ON CALL [REDACTED]	0.60
12/17/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM [REDACTED] (.2); [REDACTED] (.1)	0.30
12/17/24	JMS	REVIEW, PREPARE AND ORGANIZE [REDACTED] (3.3); CORRESPONDENCE ON [REDACTED]	4.00

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		SAME (.7)	
12/18/24	JD	REVIEW DOCUMENTS [REDACTED]	1.70
12/18/24	SJC	PREPARE FOR [REDACTED]	2.90
12/18/24	JMS	REVIEW, PREPARE AND ORGANIZE [REDACTED]	2.90
12/19/24	IMH	PREPARE FOR, [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.2); [REDACTED] (.7); [REDACTED] (.4); [REDACTED] (.3); [REDACTED] (.7)	2.80
12/19/24	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WITH GENTING LIQUIDATORS AND THEIR COUNSEL [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (2.0); [REDACTED] (1.2)	3.20
12/20/24	IMH	CONTINUE WORK ON [REDACTED]	0.80
12/20/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM [REDACTED]	0.10
12/20/24	JMS	CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. CAPUANO RE [REDACTED]	0.40
12/23/24	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO [REDACTED]	1.40
12/24/24	JMS	RESEARCH FOR [REDACTED] (1.5); [REDACTED] (1.8); [REDACTED] (1.0).	4.30
12/25/24	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH COCOUNSEL AND	0.50

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		ASSIGNEE'S TEAMS REGARDING CLAIMS RECONCILIATION AND REVIEW RELATED FILES	
12/26/24	IMH	PREPARE FOR HANDS ON CALL WITH ASSIGNEE [REDACTED] (1.2); [REDACTED] (.8); [REDACTED] (1.5); [REDACTED] (.3);	3.80
12/26/24	KW	PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE (.20); [REDACTED] (.80)	1.00
12/26/24	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM [REDACTED]	1.50
12/26/24	JMS	TELEPHONE CALLS RE [REDACTED] (.8); [REDACTED] (.6); [REDACTED] (.5); [REDACTED] (1.3)	3.20
12/27/24	IMH	REVIEW [REDACTED]	1.20
12/27/24	SJC	REVISE [REDACTED]	1.20
12/28/24	SJC	CONTINUE REVISING [REDACTED]	0.80
12/30/24	IMH	RESEARCH REGARDING [REDACTED]	1.80
12/30/24	KW	REVIEW [REDACTED]	1.00
12/30/24	SJC	REVIEW PROPOSED REVISIONS [REDACTED]	1.20
12/30/24	JMS	RESEARCH FOR [REDACTED]	3.00
12/31/24	IMH	TEAM EMAILS [REDACTED]	0.20

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
12/31/24	SJC	[REDACTED]	1.70
12/31/24	JMS	CORRESPONDENCE [REDACTED]	0.20
01/02/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS [REDACTED]	0.40
01/02/25	JMS	CORRESPONDENCE RE [REDACTED]	0.30
01/06/25	KW	INITIALLY REVIEW [REDACTED]	0.30
01/06/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING CREDITOR INQUIRIES (.2); COMMUNICATIONS [REDACTED] (.7)	0.90
01/06/25	JMS	CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE MOTION AND SCHEDULING ORDER (.2); [REDACTED] (.9)	1.10
01/07/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN TEAM CALLS [REDACTED] (.4); [REDACTED] (.2);	0.60
01/07/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS. [REDACTED]	0.40
01/07/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH TEAM [REDACTED] (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH ASSIGNEE, ASSIGNEE'S TEAM AND COCOUNSEL REGARDING CLAIMS RECONCILIATION (.5)	1.50
01/07/25	JMS	STRATEGY CALL (.5); CORRESPONDENCE FOLLOWING SAME (.2); RESEARCH IN LIGHT OF CALL (.9)	1.60
01/08/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING CLAIMS RECONCILIATION ISSUES	0.20

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
01/09/25	KW	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN MEET/CONFER WITH GENTING LEGAL TEAM REGARDING SCHEDULING ORDER ISSUES	0.40
01/09/25	KW	REVIEW REVISED PROPOSED MOTION/ORDER RE SCHEDULE ON GENTING OBJECTION	0.20
01/09/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING SCHEDULING, MEETINGS AND EMAILS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME, CONTINUE REVISING SAME, AND CIRCULATE REVISED SCHEDULING MOTION AND ORDER	1.20
01/09/25	JMS	CALL AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL	0.30
01/10/25	IMH	DEBRIEF WITH TEAM AS TO DELIVERABLES [REDACTED] (.2); FOLLOW UP WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING STATUS OF PENDING CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.2)	0.40
01/10/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS [REDACTED] (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH PI CLAIMANT (.2)	0.50
01/13/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR STATUS CALL WITH ASSIGNEE	0.20
01/13/25	KW	REVIEW/REVISE UPDATED DRAFT OF SCHEDULING MOTION, ORDER	0.50
01/13/25	SJC	CONFERENCE CALL WITH ASSIGNEE [REDACTED]	1.30
01/14/25	IMH	[REDACTED] (.3);	0.30
01/15/25	SJC	REVISE DRAFT MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER AND ORDER AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND TEAM REGARDING SAME AND RELATED MATTERS	1.00
01/16/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH VARIOUS CREDITORS REGARDING CASE STATUS (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING INTERIM REPORTS (.1)	0.40
01/17/25	IMH	REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING [REDACTED]	1.00
01/21/25	SJC	[REDACTED]	0.50

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
01/22/25	IMH	EMAILS WITH GENTING'S COUNSEL [REDACTED]	0.80
01/23/25	IMH	TEAM EMAILS [REDACTED]	0.30
01/23/25	KW	REVIEW UPDATED MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER [REDACTED]	0.50
01/23/25	SJC	REVISE MOTION TO SET SCHEDULING ORDER [REDACTED]	0.70
01/24/25	JD	[REDACTED]	0.30
01/24/25	KW	REVIEW PILLSBURY EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE [REDACTED]	0.50
01/24/25	SJC	FINALIZE AND FILE MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER AND VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND TEAM REGARDING SAME, HEARING, AND RELATED MATTERS (1.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING STATUS OF CASE AND GENTING OBJECTION (.2)	1.30
01/27/25	JD	DRAFT, FINALIZE, FORMAT AND FILE NOTICE OF HEARING TO CONSIDER ASSIGNEE'S MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER ON ITS OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO CLAIMS (.30); PROVIDE ELECTRONIC SERVICE OF NOTICE OF HEARING ON ADDITIONAL PARTIES (.10)	0.40
01/27/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR STATUS CALL WITH ASSIGNEE AND PROFESSIONALS (.3); PARTICIPATE IN SAME (.5);	0.80
01/27/25	KW	REVIEW/CONFIRM FILING-APPEARANCE REGARDING HEARING ON SCHEDULING MOTION	0.20
01/27/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] (.7); REVIEW CLAIMS RECONCILIATION (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING GENTING CLAIM OBJECTION (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND TEAM REGARDING HEARING ON MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER, REVIEW AND FINALIZE NOTICE OF HEARING AND FILE SAME (.7)	1.90
01/28/25	IMH	STRATEGIZE REGARDING UNIVERSE OF CLAIMS AND OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO REMAINING CLAIMS (.3); [REDACTED]	0.60

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		[REDACTED] (.3);	
01/28/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING CLAIMS REGISTER (.2); REVIEW JOINDER FILED BY CREDITOR AND COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING SAME (.2)	0.40
01/29/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO GENTING SCHEDULING ORDER (.3); TEAM EMAILS REGARDING TODAY'S HEARINGS AND NEXT CASE MANAGEMENT HEARING (.2)	0.50
01/29/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING STATUS (.2); REVIEW ORDER SETTING CMCS (.1); [REDACTED] (.4)	0.70
01/30/25	IMH	RESEARCH REGARDING PROTOCOL AND POLICY FOR PROVIDING CREDITOR INFORMATION IN ABC	1.10
01/30/25	KW	REVIEW FOR PREPARATION REGARDING ORDER SCHEDULING INTERIM CMCS / CMC ON MONDAY FEB. 3	0.20
01/30/25	KW	FURTHER REVIEW [REDACTED]	0.30
01/30/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COCOUNSEL REGARDING PREPARATION FOR CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND OTHER CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.8); [REDACTED] (.2)	1.00
01/31/25	IMH	STRATEGIZE WITH TEAM REGARDING NEXT STEPS IN SEA INVEST CLAIM DISPUTE (.3); FOLLOW UP WITH PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMS' COUNSEL REGARDING POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING SAME (.2);	0.70
01/31/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND [REDACTED] (1.1) COMMUNICATIONS WITH COCOUNSEL REGARDING CLAIMS ISSUE (.2); PREPARE FOR CMC (.4).	1.70
01/31/25	HJG	REVIEW DOCUMENTS [REDACTED]	1.20
02/02/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.5); RESEARCH [REDACTED] (1.0)	1.50
02/03/25	IMH	WORK ON MOTION TO DISPOSE OF REMAINING CONSUMER CLAIMS AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING	3.70

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		PROCEDURE FOR RESOLVING SAME (1.4); TEAM EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS REGARDING TODAY'S CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.4); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.8); TEAM DISCUSSIONS AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO AMEX SETTLEMENT (.4); TEAM CALL TO DISCUSS OPEN CLAIMS ISSUES (.5); REVIEW DOCKET REGARDING LAST FEE APPLICATIONS FOR ASSIGNEE PROFESSIONALS (.2);	
02/03/25	KW	ATTEND CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE	0.40
02/03/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.50
02/03/25	KW	REVIEW GENTING'S RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER	0.40
02/03/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND CREDITOR COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (1.3); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (1.8); [REDACTED] (.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING AMEX NEGOTIATIONS (.4); REVIEW RESPONSE TO MOTION TO SET SCHEDULING ORDER [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.5).	4.90
02/03/25	HJG	[REDACTED] (.5); RESEARCH REGARDING ASSIGNEE'S OBLIGATIONS IN CONNECTION WITH UNCLAIMED FUNDS (1.1); [REDACTED] (0.3); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (0.2)	2.10
02/04/25	IMH	[REDACTED] (1.2); [REDACTED] (.5); ANALYSIS OF OPTIONS RELATED TO UNCLAIMED FUNDS (.5); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.3);	2.50
02/04/25	CC	UPLOAD DOCUMENTS FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER ON OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO	0.30

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		CLAIM OF GENTING INTO COURTMAP.	
02/04/25	KW	FURTHER REVIEW REGARDING RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER, [REDACTED]	0.80
02/04/25	SJC	REVIEW DRAFT CONSUMER CLAIMS REGISTER [REDACTED] CIRCULATE SAME TO COUNSEL FOR GENTING (.6); [REDACTED] (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING CMC COVERAGE (.1); [REDACTED] (.7); [REDACTED] (.2); [REDACTED] (.8)	2.60
02/04/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	3.30
02/05/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING NOTICE OPTIONS RELATED TO CONSUMER CLAIMS (.3); RESEARCH PREVIOUS ABC CASES FOR PRECEDENT (1.7); [REDACTED] (.3); RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS IN SUPPORT MOTION TO OBJECT TO UNCLAIMED CONSUMER CLAIMS AS ALTERNATE METHOD FOR RESOLVING SAME (.9)	3.20
02/05/25	CC	CONDUCT RESEARCH ON PRECEDENT FOR MOTION TO DISALLOW CLAIMS FOR UNCLAIMED FUNDS.	1.00
02/05/25	CC	CONFER WITH M. SALBO AND I. HOMER RE MOTION FOR INSTRUCTION ON UNCLAIMED FUNDS.	0.30
02/05/25	KW	REVIEW CLAIMS REGISTERS / EMAIL CORRESP RE FURTHER PREP FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER	0.30
02/05/25	SJC	[REDACTED] (1.3); [REDACTED] (.5); [REDACTED] (.2); REVIEW AND DISSEMINATE CLAIMS REGISTERS TO COUNSEL FOR GENTING [REDACTED]	3.30

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		[REDACTED] (.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION AND ISSUES (.4)	
02/05/25	HJG	[REDACTED] (2.4); FURTHER RESEARCH REGARDING DISTRIBUTION OF UNCLAIMED FUNDS (1.1)	3.50
02/06/25	IMH	PREPARE OBJECTION TO UNCLAIMED CONSUMER CLAIMS (1.8); [REDACTED] (.9); [REDACTED] (.3); [REDACTED] (.7)	3.70
02/06/25	CC	WORK ON ASSIGNEE'S MOTION FOR INSTRUCTION REGARDING UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTION FUNDS.	1.50
02/06/25	KW	ATTEND HEARING ON MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER [REDACTED] (0.8); [REDACTED] (0.4)	1.20
02/06/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING ON MOTION TO SET SCHEDULING ORDER [REDACTED] (1.8); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION (.7); [REDACTED] (.7)	3.20
02/06/25	HJG	[REDACTED] (1.3); [REDACTED] (4.2)	5.50
02/07/25	IMH	COMMUNICATE WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING CONSUMER CLAIMS AND CATEGORIES OF CLAIMANTS WITH UNCLAIMED FUNDS (.4); REVISE MOTION TO DISALLOW CERTAIN CLAIMS AND REVISE POINTS OF INQUIRY ON CHART FOR ASSIGNEE'S TEAM TO FOLLOW UP (.9); [REDACTED] (.8); [REDACTED] (.2)	2.30

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
02/07/25	KW	REVIEW UPDATED DRAFT OF PROPOSED SCHEDULING ORDER [REDACTED]	0.70
02/07/25	SJC	REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED SCHEDULING ORDER AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING SAME (.6); COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION (.2); [REDACTED] (.8)	1.60
02/10/25	IMH	EMAILS WITH M SALBO REGARDING UNCASHED CHECKS OF CONSUMER CLAIMANTS AND REVIEW CHART REGARDING SAME (.6); DISCUSSIONS REGARDING REMAINING OPEN ISSUES AND CONTENTS OF MOTION TO BE FILED SEEKING DIRECTION WITH RESPECT TO SAME (.8); [REDACTED] (.2); REVIEW PREVIOUS JUDGE WALSH ORDERS REGARDING SAME (.3);	1.90
02/10/25	CC	WORK ON MOTION FOR INSTRUCTION REGARDING UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS.	1.50
02/10/25	CC	REVIEW CHART PROVIDED BY M. SALBO OF HEALY'S OFFICE RE CONTACTS MADE WITH CLAIMANTS ABOUT DISTRIBUTIONS.	1.00
02/10/25	KW	REVIEW/REVISE UPDATED DRAFT OF PROPOSED COUNTER-SUBMISSION RE SCHEDULING ORDER	0.50
02/10/25	SJC	REVISE PROPOSED SCHEDULING ORDER AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME, AND CIRCULATE SAME TO COUNSEL FOR GENTING (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION AND REVIEW RELATED DATA (.2)	0.80
02/11/25	IMH	WORK ON PARING DOWN UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION BASED ON NEW INFORMATION PROVIDED BY ASSIGNEE (.8); PREPARE PROPOSED ORDER REGARDING SAME (.4); [REDACTED] (.5); STRATEGIZE REGARDING NEXT ROUND OF FEE APPLICATIONS FOR ASSIGNEE PROFESSIONALS (.2);	1.90
02/11/25	CC	WORK ON MOTION TO DISALLOW CLAIMS FOR CLAIMANTS WITH UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS.	1.20
02/11/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.80

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
02/11/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION [REDACTED] (.6); [REDACTED] (.5);	1.10
02/11/25	HJG	[REDACTED] (0.4); [REDACTED] (1.4); [REDACTED] (0.7)	2.50
02/12/25	IMH	BEGIN REDACTION OF INVOICES FOR FEE APPLICATIONS OF ASSIGNEE PROFESSIONALS (.4); FURTHER TEAM DISCUSSIONS AND REVISIONS TO MOTION TO DISALLOW CLAIMS RELATED TO UNCLAIMED FUNDS (.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M SALBO AND TEAM DISCUSSIONS THROUGHOUT THE DAY REGARDING SAME (.6);	1.50
02/12/25	CC	WORK ON EXHIBIT TO MOTION TO DISALLOW UNCLAIMED FUNDS.	1.20
02/12/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.40
02/12/25	SJC	[REDACTED]	0.80
02/13/25	IMH	[REDACTED] (2.4); REVISE ATTACHMENT TO UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION (.4); COMMUNICATE WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SAME (.3);	3.10
02/13/25	KW	[REDACTED] [1.8]; [REDACTED] [0.4]; REVIEW PILLSBURY REVISED PROPOSED SCHED ORDER [0.3]	2.50
02/13/25	SJC	REVIEW PROPOSED CHANGES SCHEDULING ORDER AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.3); [REDACTED] (.1.0); [REDACTED] (.5).	1.80
02/13/25	HJG	[REDACTED] (1.5);	2.50

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		[REDACTED] (0.6); [REDACTED] (0.4)	
02/14/25	IMH	[REDACTED] (1.6); [REDACTED] (.2);	1.80
02/14/25	KW	[REDACTED] [0.5]; REVIEW FOR STATUS REGARDING FURTHER REVISION TO PROPOSED JOINT SCHEDULING ORDER [0.3]	0.80
02/14/25	SJC	[REDACTED] (.2); FINALIZE AND SUBMIT SCHEDULING ORDER AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND TEAM REGARDING SAME AND RELATED MATTERS (.6)	0.80
02/15/25	IMH	[REDACTED]	2.00
02/17/25	IMH	FOLLOW UP WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING REVISIONS TO CHART FOR UNCLAIMED FUNDS (.3); [REDACTED] (.9); [REDACTED] (.3)	1.50
02/17/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	1.30
02/18/25	IMH	[REDACTED] (.4); EMAILS WITH M SALBO REGARDING INFORMATION FOR UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION (.2); TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING SAME (.2)	0.80
02/18/25	CC	WORK ON MOTION TO DISALLOW CLAIMS OF CLAIMANTS WITH UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS.	0.90
02/18/25	CC	REVIEW BSLLP INVOICE FOR NEXT ROUND OF FEE APPLICATIONS.	1.00
02/18/25	SJC	[REDACTED] (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING UNCLAIMED FUNDS ISSUES (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.2)	0.70

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
02/19/25	IMH	REVIEW GENTING'S RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION [REDACTED]	0.90
02/19/25	CC	BEGIN PREPARATION OF NEXT FEE APPLICATION FOR BERGER SINGERMAN LLP.	0.80
02/19/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.50
02/19/25	SJC	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF RESPONSE TO OBJECTION TO GENTING CLAIM [REDACTED] (.9); (1.0); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING STATUS (.2)	2.10
02/19/25	HJG	[REDACTED] (2.1); (1.2); (2.1)	5.40
02/20/25	IMH	[REDACTED] (2.8); (.2);	3.00
02/20/25	CC	PREPARE E-BINDER ON OBJECTION TO GENTING CLAIMS.	0.80
02/20/25	CC	WORK ON MOTION TO DISALLOW CLAIMS OF CLAIMANTS WITH UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS AND PREPARE CORRESPONDING EXHIBIT.	0.70
02/20/25	SJC	[REDACTED] (1.0); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING JOINDER AND CLAIM ISSUES AND REVIEW JOINDER (.2)	1.20
02/20/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	0.40
02/21/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR NEXT WEEK'S STATUS CONFERENCE	0.30
02/21/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING MAIN CASE STATUS (.2); [REDACTED] (.3)	0.50
02/23/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS. [REDACTED]	0.40

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		[REDACTED]	
02/24/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING OPEN INVOICES FOR ASSIGNEE PROFESSIONALS (.2); FOLLOW UP REGARDING UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME (.4); PREPARE ORDER REQUIRING NOTICE AND DISALLOWING CLAIMS (.3); ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO NEXT CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.6);	1.70
02/24/25	CC	WORK ON MOTION TO DISALLOW CLAIMS OF CLAIMANTS WITH UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS.	0.60
02/24/25	SJC	REVISE MOTION FOR ORDER DISALLOWING CLAIMS WITH UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS AND ORDER ON SAME AND PREPARE FINAL NOTICE TO CLAIM DISTRIBUTIONS, AND CIRCULATE SAME TO TEAM, AND VARIOUS MEETINGS AND TELEPHONE CALLS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME AND RELATED MATTERS	2.10
02/25/25	IMH	REVISE SPREADSHEET AND EXHIBIT TO UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION AND TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING REVISING AND FINALIZING SAME (1.2); [REDACTED] (1.2)	2.40
02/25/25	CC	WORK ON MOTION FOR DISALLOWANCE OF CLAIMS WITH UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS.	0.80
02/25/25	CC	WORK ON E-BINDER FOR GENTING OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO CLAIMS.	1.00
02/25/25	SJC	REVIEW AND ANALYZE ALL PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMS INCLUDING DEMANDS, REVISED DEMANDS, BACKUP DOCUMENTATION, AND ANALYSES FROM PI COUNSEL, AND PREPARE AND SEND MEMO TO ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (3.5); [REDACTED], AMEX DISPUTE, OTHER POTENTIAL RECOVERIES, UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION, AND VARIOUS OTHER CASE MATTERS (1.0); CONTINUE WORKING ON UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.6)	5.10
02/26/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING DISPOSITION OF PI CLAIMS AND FILING OF OBJECTIONS TO SAME (1.6); COMMUNICATE WITH M SALBO REGARDING EXHIBIT TO UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION AND FURTHER REVISIONS TO SAME (.5); [REDACTED] (.2); REVIEW BERMUDEZ AND JANSEN	2.70

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		ADVERSARIES AND SETTLEMENTS (.4)	
02/26/25	SJC	[REDACTED] (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR CREDITOR REGARDING STATUS (.2)	0.40
02/27/25	IMH	STRATEGIZE REGARDING AMEX SETTLEMENT (.2); [REDACTED] (.3); [REDACTED] (.2);	0.70
02/27/25	SJC	CONTINUE REVISING MOTION REGARDING UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SAME	0.70
02/28/25	IMH	[REDACTED] (.5); [REDACTED] (.2)	0.70
02/28/25	CC	FINALIZE AND E-FILE ASSIGNEE'S MOTION FOR ORDER DISALLOWING CLAIMS WITH UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS.	0.80
02/28/25	CC	PREPARE, FINALIZE AND E-FILE NOTICE OF HEARING ON MOTION FOR ORDER DISALLOWING CLAIMS WITH UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS.	0.60
02/28/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS REGARDING CMC	0.20
02/28/25	SJC	FINALIZE REVIEW OF PI CLAIMANT DOCUMENTS AND INFORMATION AND PREPARE AND SEND SETTLEMENT OFFERS FOR ALL PI CLAIMANTS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (1.8); FINALIZE AND FILE MOTION REGARDING UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS AND NOTICE OF HEARING AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.0); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.2)	3.00
03/01/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR 3/3 CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (1.1); REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMS (.4)	1.50
03/01/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE	0.70
03/03/25	IMH	DEBRIEF REGARDING TODAY'S CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.2); [REDACTED] (.4); REVISE NOTICE TO CLAIMANTS OF UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS (.3);	0.90
03/03/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.40

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		[REDACTED]	
03/03/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING CONSUMER OBJECTIONS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SERVICE OF UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS MOTION (.2); [REDACTED] (.2)	1.90
03/04/25	IMH	[REDACTED] (.4); STRATEGIZE WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING STATUS OF CONSUMER OBJECTIONS (.3); ATTN TO NEXT STEPS FOR RESOLVING PI CLAIMS (.8); ATTN TO OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO NOTICE AND RE-SERVING CLAIMANTS OF UNCLAIMED AMOUNTS (.4)	1.90
03/04/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.50
03/04/25	SJC	[REDACTED] (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLAIMANT AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING UNCLAIMED FUNDS (.8)	0.80
03/04/25	HJG	[REDACTED] (0.9); [REDACTED] (0.5); [REDACTED] (2.1)	3.50
03/05/25	IMH	REVIEW AND UPDATE LIST OF CLAIMANTS RESPONDING TO MOTION REGARDING UNCLAIMED FUNDS AND COMMUNICATE WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SAME (.6);	0.60
03/05/25	SJC	CONFERENCE CALLS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING VARIOUS CASE MATTERS [REDACTED], UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS, CREDIT CARD RECOVERIES, AND OTHER MATTERS (.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH PI COUNSEL REGARDING STATUS (.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS CLAIMANTS (.2);	1.00
03/06/25	IMH	[REDACTED]	2.70

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		(1.6); (.5); (.4); COMMUNICATE WITH GRAMMES REGARDING POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT OF CEYHAN CLAIM (.2)	
03/06/25	KW		0.80
03/06/25	SJC	(.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLAIMANT REGARDING STATUS AND CLAIMS (.2);	1.10
03/06/25	HJG	(0.6); (0.7)	1.30
03/07/25	CC	PREPARE, FINALIZE AND E-FILE NOTICE OF FILING AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE OF MOTION TO DISALLOW CLAIMS WITH UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS.	0.40
03/07/25	CC	UPLOAD ORDER SUSTAINING 53RD OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO CONSUMER CLAIMS AND REVIEW DOCKET FOR ANY MISSING ORDERS REGARDING CONSUMER CLAIM OBJECTIONS FILED BY ASSIGNEE.	0.40
03/07/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR PI CLAIMANTS AND SEND MEMO TO ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (1.0); REVIEW AND SUBMIT ORDER ON 53RD OMNIBUS CONSUMER CLAIM OBJECTION AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.3)	1.30
03/09/25	IMH	TEAM EMAILS REGARDING COUNTER OFFERS FOR PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMANTS (.2)	0.20
03/09/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING PI CLAIMS AND SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS, AND PREPARE AND SEND COUNTER-OFFERS ON SEVERAL PI CLAIMS	0.80
03/10/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR TODAY'S HANDS ON STATUS CALL WITH ASSIGNEE (.4); PARTICIPATE IN SAME (.5); ATTN TO POST CALL DELIVERABLES (.2); (.2);	1.30
03/10/25	SJC		1.90

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		[REDACTED]	
		(.8); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING MONEYSHOW CLAIM AND OBJECTION AND CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR MONEYSHOW REGARDING SAME AND ANALYZE CLAIM (.9); [REDACTED] (.2)	
03/11/25	IMH	[REDACTED] (.3); TEAM DISCUSSIONS AND FOLLOW UP REGARDING OBJECTION TO MONEYSHOW CLAIM AND DISCOVERY RELATED THERETO (.4); REVISE ORDER GRANTING MOTION TO DISALLOW UNCLAIMED FUNDS (.3); DISCUSSION WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING FILING OF NEXT GROUP OF FEE APPLICATIONS FOR ASSIGNEE PROFESSIONALS (.2)	1.20
03/11/25	SJC	RECEIPT OF COUNTER OFFERS FROM PI CLAIMANTS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (.5); WORK WITH TEAM ON OBJECTION TO MONEYSHOW CLAIM AND RESEARCH REGARDING SAME AND COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING SAME (.8)	1.30
03/12/25	IMH	DISCUSSIONS TO RESOLVE PENDING PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMS AND TEAM EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY TO REQUEST FROM MONEYSHOW (.8); FOLLOW UP REGARDING RESPONSES TO MOTION TO DISALLOW CLAIMS WITH UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS (.2); [REDACTED] (.3);	1.70
03/12/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS WITH PI CLAIMANTS AND SEND COUNTER OFFERS (.6); PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH CREDITORS REGARDING CASE STATUS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (1.0)	1.60
03/13/25	IMH	COMMUNICATE WITH ASSIGNEE'S OFFICE REGARDING PENDING ORDERS RELATED TO GRANTED CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.2); [REDACTED] (.3); [REDACTED] (.3); REVIEW FILES REGARDING SAME (.4);	1.20

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
03/13/25	SJC	[REDACTED] (.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING MONEYSHOW CLAIM OBJECTION (.2)	0.70
03/13/25	JMS	FURTHER PREPARE OBJECTION (2.3); FOLLOW UP RESEARCH (.9)	3.10
03/14/25	IMH	TEAM CALLS TO DISCUSS STATUS OF REMAINING CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND UPCOMING COURT HEARINGS (.4);	0.40
03/14/25	SJC	[REDACTED] (.3); RECEIPT OF COUNTER OFFERS FROM PI CLAIMANTS AND SEND MEMO TO ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR COUNSEL AND TEAM REGARDING LOCAL RULES (.5)	1.20
03/15/25	IMH	REVISE DISCOVERY TO MONEYSHOW AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING OPTIMIZING SETTLEMENT POTENTIAL (.8); ATTN TO OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO RESOLUTION OF PI CLAIMS (.3)	1.10
03/17/25	SJC	WORK ON MONEYSHOW OBJECTION AND RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (1.2); REVIEW ORDER ON OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO CONSUMER CLAIMS (.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING CLAIMS AND STATUS (.2)	1.50
03/17/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	1.40
03/18/25	IMH	[REDACTED]	0.30
03/18/25	SJC	CONTINUE WORKING ON MONEYSHOW OBJECTION AND REQUEST FOR DOCUMENTS AND REVIEW PROPOSED CHANGES TO SAME AND MEETINGS AND CONFERENCES WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.7); [REDACTED] (2.3); [REDACTED] (.3);	4.30
03/18/25	JMS	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF REVISED MOTION (.7); CONDUCT ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY/RESEARCH (1.6); FURTHER REVISIONS (1.5)	3.90
03/18/25	HJG	[REDACTED] (1.3); [REDACTED] (1.5);	5.20

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		(1.1); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (1.3)	
03/19/25	IMH	[REDACTED]	0.40
03/19/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.50
03/19/25	SJC	[REDACTED] (.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ESI TEAM REGARDING DISCOVERY ON MONEYSHOW (.5)	1.20
03/19/25	JMS	REVISIONS TO OBJECTION; STRATEGY RE SAME; ALSO ATTN TO ESI PROTOCOLS	3.10
03/19/25	HJG	[REDACTED] (6.0); [REDACTED] (1.3)	7.30
03/20/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING PI CLAIMS (.2); [REDACTED] (.4)	0.60
03/20/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	7.40
03/21/25	IMH	FOLLOW UP WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF PENDING PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMS	0.20
03/21/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.20
03/21/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	4.20
03/22/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR NEXT WEEK'S CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE	0.40
03/24/25	IMH	REVIEW TASK LIST AND REVISE SAME (.3); ATTN TO OPEN CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND FOLLOW UP WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SAME (.9); [REDACTED] (.4);	1.60
03/24/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.50
03/24/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.40

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
03/25/25	IMH	REVIEW NYK JOINDER TO GENTING OBJECTION AND REVIEW LIST OF CREDITORS EXPRESSING INTEREST IN DOING SAME (.3); ATTN TO ISSUES RELEVANT TO UPCOMING CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.4); WORK ON REDACTIONS IN BILLS TO BE ATTACHED TO FEE APPLICATION (.8)	1.50
03/25/25	HJG	[REDACTED] (0.2); [REDACTED] (3.7)	3.90
03/26/25	IMH	TEAM STATUS CALL, EMAILS AND UPDATE AS TO OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO CLAIMS (.3); FOLLOW UP REGARDING STATUS OF AMEX DISCUSSIONS (.2); STRATEGIZE REGARDING LOGISTICS FOLLOWING RULING ON UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION (.3); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (4); TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING ISSUES FOR NEXT CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.2); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.2)	1.60
03/26/25	KW	INITIALLY REVIEW AND ASSESS GENTING 3D PARTY DISCOVERY SUBPOENAS AND EXTENSIVE RFP	0.50
03/26/25	SJC	REVIEW SUBPOENA FROM GENTING TO ACCOUNTING FIRMS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.7); REVIEW REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION FROM GENTING AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.6); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.9); CONTINUE REVISING MONEYSHOW OBJECTION AND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION AND SEND DRAFTS TO ASSIGNEE (1.0); PREPARE FOR HEARING ON MOTION REGARDING UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS (.8)	4.00
03/26/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	6.70
03/27/25	IMH	[REDACTED] (.7); [REDACTED] (.4); DEBRIEF REGARDING UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION AND PREPARE FOR UPCOMING CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.7);	1.80
03/27/25	KW	REVIEW STATUS / STRATEGY ITEMS WITH LEGAL	1.80

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		TEAM RE RFP AND 3D PARTY SUBPOENAS [0.8]; DRAFT RFC [0.5]; [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [0.5]	
03/27/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING ON MOTION REGARDING UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM, ASSIGNEE AND ASSIGNEE’S TEAM REGARDING SAME AND SUBMIT PROPOSED ORDER ON SAME (1.4); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.6); [REDACTED] PI CLAIMS, AND GENERAL CASE STATUS (.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR PI CLAIMANTS REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS (.6); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.7); FINALIZE MONEYSHOW OBJECTION AND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION AND SEND DRAFTS TO COUNSEL FOR MONEYSHOW AND SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS, AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.0); [REDACTED] (.3)	5.50
03/27/25	HJG	ANALYZE GENTING LIQUIDATORS' REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION TO ASSIGNEE (0.4); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (0.5); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (2.4); [REDACTED] (1.6)	4.90
03/28/25	IMH	[REDACTED] [REDACTED] (2.2); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.3); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.5); FOLLOW UP REGARDING NEXT CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.2); DISCUSSIONS REGARDING POTENTIAL MONEYSHOW SETTLEMENT (.2)	3.40
03/28/25	CC	BEGIN REVIEWING INVOICES BEGINNING OCTOBER 1, 2024 IN PREPARATION OF NEXT INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	1.00
03/28/25	CC	FINALIZE ORDER GRANTING MOTION TO DISALLOW CLAIMS WITH UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS AND UPLOAD SAME INTO COURTMAP.	0.30

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
03/28/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.30
03/28/25	KW	FURTHER REVIEW AND ANALYSIS RE PENDING DISCOVERY ISSUES	0.20
03/28/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR MONEYSHOW AND FURTHER COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM, ASSIGNEE AND COUNSEL FOR MONEYSHOW REGARDING SAME (.9); [REDACTED] (1.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING DISCOVERY AND MEET AND CONFER (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS ORDER AND CMC (.2)	2.40
03/28/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	2.10
03/31/25	IMH	COORDINATE WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING REMAINING CLAIMS INCLUDING POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT OF PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMS AND REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.5), OUTSTANDING ORDERS APPROVING CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.3); AND OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO UNCLAIMED FUNDS (.4); PREPARE SUBMISSION RELATED TO UPCOMING CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCES (.2); [REDACTED] (2.4); PREPARE FOR GENTING MEET AND CONFER (.3)	4.10
03/31/25	KW	REVIEW STATUS REGARDING DISCOVERY MEET/CONFER	0.20
03/31/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING DISCOVERY (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR PI CLAIMANTS REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS (.2)	0.40
03/31/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	2.60
04/01/25	IMH	REVIEW INVOICES IN SUPPORT OF BERGER SINGERMAN FEE APPLICATION AND WORK ON REDACTIONS RELATED TO SAME (1.8); [REDACTED]	3.40

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		<p>[REDACTED] (.8); PREPARE FOR MEET AND CONFER WITH REMAINING PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMANTS (.4); FOLLOW UP WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SAME (.2); [REDACTED] (.2):</p>	
04/01/25	SJC	<p>PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR PI CLAIMANTS AND SEND MEMO TO ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME WITH ANALYSIS (.7); [REDACTED]</p>	1.50
04/01/25	HJG	<p>[REDACTED]</p>	3.80
04/02/25	IMH	<p>[REDACTED] TEAM EMAILS REGARDING NEXT STEPS FOLLOWING SAME (.3); [REDACTED]</p>	2.00
04/02/25	KW	<p>REVIEW/ASSESS [REDACTED]</p>	0.40
04/02/25	SJC	<p>PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WITH MONEYSHOW COUNSEL AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING SAME (.6); [REDACTED] CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR PI CLAIMANTS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING SETTLEMENT OFFERS (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING DISCOVERY PROJECT (.2)</p>	1.90
04/02/25	HJG	<p>[REDACTED]</p>	2.40

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		[REDACTED] CORRESPOND WITH D. HASLAM REGARDING DOCUMENT REQUESTS (0.2)	
04/03/25	IMH	[REDACTED] CONTINUE REVIEW OF ATTACHMENTS TO FEE APPLICATION FOR ASSIGNEE'S COUNSEL (1.2)	2.50
04/03/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	1.80
04/04/25	IMH	[REDACTED]	0.80
04/04/25	CC	REVIEW INVOICES FOR NEXT INTERIM FEE APPLICATION FROM OCTOBER 1, 2024 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2025.	1.00
04/04/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.20
04/04/25	SJC	[REDACTED] COMMUNICATIONS WITH PI COUNSEL AND TEAM REGARDING SETTLING OF CLAIMS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.1)	1.30
04/04/25	HJG	TELECONFERENCE WITH I. HOMER	0.10
04/07/25	IMH	[REDACTED] TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING CONSISTENCY IN EXHIBITS TO PROFESSIONAL FEE APPLICATIONS AND STRATEGIZE FOR IMPLEMENTING SAME (.3);	1.40
04/07/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.70
04/07/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.30
04/07/25	SJC	[REDACTED]	1.70

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		[REDACTED] COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.1)	
04/07/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	1.60
04/08/25	SJC	CONFERENCE CALLS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE, COUNSEL FOR PI CLAIMANTS AND TEAM REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS, EXCHANGE FURTHER COUNTER OFFERS ON SOME, [REDACTED] CONFERENCE CALL WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING VARIOUS MATTERS INCLUDING CLAIMS ISSUES AND LITIGATION (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CO-COUNSEL REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING FINAL NOTICE REGARDING UNCLAIMED DISTRIBUTIONS, SERVICE, AND RELATED MATTERS, AND REVIEW ORDER ENTERED ON SAME (.6).	3.20
04/09/25	IMH	[REDACTED] TEAM EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS REGARDING STATUS OF POTENTIAL SETTLEMENTS OF PENDING CLAIMS (.3); WORK ON BERGER SINGERMAN FEE APPLICATION (.3); [REDACTED]	1.60
04/09/25	CC	FINALIZE INVOICE FOR BSLLP NEXT INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	0.60
04/09/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATION AND RELATED MATTERS AND REVIEW [REDACTED]	1.40
04/09/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	3.90

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		[REDACTED] REDACT INVOICE FOR USE IN FEE APPLICATION (1.4)	
04/10/25	IMH	[REDACTED]	0.90
04/10/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.30
04/10/25	SJC	[REDACTED] WORK ON FEE APPLICATION (.7)	1.90
04/10/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	0.60
04/11/25	IMH	[REDACTED] TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING SETTLEMENTS OF REMAINING PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMS (.2);	1.60
04/11/25	KW	[REDACTED]	1.00
04/11/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.50
04/11/25	SJC	[REDACTED] CONFERENCE CALLS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR PI CLAIMANT AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING SETTLEMENT (.8);	3.50
04/11/25	JR	[REDACTED]	0.80
04/11/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	3.70

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		POTENTIAL AM EX SETTLEMENT (.2); FOLLOW UP REGARDING OPEN MATTERS AND ORDERS TO STILL BE ENTERED BY THE COURT (.3); STRATEGIZE REGARDING NEXT CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND TOPICS FOR PRESENTATION AT SAME (.3);	
04/15/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.40
04/15/25	SJC	[REDACTED] COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING THIRD PARTY SUBPOENA AND REVIEW AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE (.2)	1.30
04/15/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	1.40
04/16/25	IMH	[REDACTED]	0.80
04/16/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.40
04/16/25	SJC	[REDACTED]	1.30
04/16/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	3.80
04/17/25	IMH	[REDACTED]	1.20
04/17/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.20
04/17/25	SJC	[REDACTED]	1.00

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	
		[REDACTED]		
04/17/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	3.60	
04/18/25	IMH	[REDACTED]	0.50	
04/18/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.30	
04/18/25	SJC	[REDACTED]	0.70	
04/18/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	0.60	
04/21/25	IMH	[REDACTED] CALL WITH CLERK'S OFFICE REGARDING UPCOMING CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCES (.2);	0.40	
04/21/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.50	
04/21/25	SJC	[REDACTED]	2.30	
04/21/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	0.80	
04/21/25	MJH	[REDACTED]	0.60	N/C
04/22/25	IMH	[REDACTED]	0.40	
04/22/25	SJC	[REDACTED]	0.70	

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		[REDACTED]	
04/23/25	KW	[REDACTED]	1.00
04/23/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.30
04/23/25	SJC	[REDACTED]; COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR PI CLAIMANT REGARDING STATUS (.1); [REDACTED]	2.50
04/23/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	1.00
04/24/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS AND FOLLOW UP REGARDING OPEN CLAIM OBJECTIONS [REDACTED] [REDACTED] TEAM EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.2); [REDACTED] UP WITH CLERK'S OFFICE REGARDING UPCOMING CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.2)	1.60
04/24/25	CC	[REDACTED]	0.30
04/24/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.50
04/24/25	KW	[REDACTED]	1.00
04/24/25	SJC	CONFERENCE CALLS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH ESI TEAM, TEAM, ASSIGNEE, AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM [REDACTED]	4.20

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	
		[REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING OBJECTION TO PI CLAIMANT AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR CLAIMANT REGARDING WITHDRAWAL (.2)		
04/24/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	1.10	
04/24/25	MJH	[REDACTED]	0.20	N/C
04/24/25	MJH	[REDACTED]	0.60	N/C
04/24/25	MJH	[REDACTED]	0.10	N/C
04/25/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.30	
04/25/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING OBJECTION TO PI CLAIMS, REVISE AND FINALIZE AND FILE SAME WITH EXHIBIT (.7); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR CREDITOR REGARDING INTERIM CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND PREPARE FOR SAME (.2)	1.50	
04/25/25	HJG	DRAFT OBJECTION TO CLAIM NO. 3042	1.40	
04/26/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.30	
04/28/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING SUBMISSION OF ORDER ON CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCES (.2); FOLLOW UP WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING PENDING CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.3);	0.50	
04/28/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.20	
04/28/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME	1.10	
04/29/25	IMH	ATTN TO SERVICE ISSUES RELATED TO UNCLAIMED FUNDS MOTION	0.60	
04/29/25	CC	FINALIZE AND E-FILE ASSIGNEE'S OBJECTION TO CLAIM OF MIKTO LAPTALO.	0.30	

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
04/29/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.70
04/29/25	SJC	[REDACTED] DRAFT AND FILE MOTION TO EXTEND DEADLINE FOR UNCLAIMED FUNDS CLAIMANTS TO RESPOND TO NOTICE AND ORDER ON SAME AND VARIOUS CONFERENCE CALLS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM, ASSIGNEE, AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SAME AND RELATED MATTERS (1.5); CONFERENCE WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING CREDIT CARD RECEIVABLE, CLAIM ISSUES AND OTHER CASE MATTERS (.5); FINALIZE OBJECTION TO PI CLAIM AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME AND FILE SAME (.6)	4.70
04/29/25	HJG	[REDACTED]	0.20
04/30/25	IMH	[REDACTED] STRATEGIZE REGARDING OFFERS TO REMAINING PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMANTS (.2);	0.40
04/30/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.60
04/30/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.30
04/30/25	SJC	[REDACTED] COMMUNICATIONS WITH PI CLAIMANT, ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING OBJECTION TO CLAIM AND SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS, REVIEW SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION FROM CLAIMANT, AND PRESENT SETTLEMENT OFFER (1.0); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR MONEYSHOW REGARDING SETTLEMENT PROPOSALS, DRAFT OBJECTION AND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION, AND RELATED MATTERS (.6)	3.10

Total Hours:

708.50

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
	Total Fees:		462,186.50

F E E S U M M A R Y

Attorney	Hours	Rate	Total
Paul Avron	27.90	715.00	19,948.50
Samuel J. Capuano	68.20	635.00	43,307.00
Samuel J. Capuano	133.10	700.00	93,170.00
Carmen Cruz	7.80	325.00	2,535.00
Carmen Cruz	20.30	425.00	8,627.50
Janette Diaz	15.30	325.00	4,972.50
Janette Diaz	0.70	425.00	297.50
Hunter J. Grasso	114.60	525.00	60,165.00
Mary Joann Hill	1.50	0.00	0.00
Ilyse M. Homer	80.00	725.00	58,000.00
Ilyse M. Homer	103.40	810.00	83,754.00
Jesse Richman	1.30	465.00	604.50
Jennifer Schein	100.20	600.00	60,120.00
Kenneth W. Waterway	2.70	725.00	1,957.50
Kenneth W. Waterway	31.50	785.00	24,727.50
	Total	708.50	\$462,186.50

E X P E N S E S

Date	Description	Amount
03/16/25	VENDOR: CLASS ACTION COURT REPORTERS; INVOICE#: 8138; DATE: 3/16/2025 - 30806.0001 APPEARANCE FEE, ORIGINAL TRANSCRIPT, MINI AND WORD INDEX, ELECTRONIC FILE	313.20
	E-DISCOVERY DATA STORAGE FEE (\$12 PER GB)	15,132.00
	REPRODUCTION	12.60
	WESTLAW CHARGES	1,950.18
	Total Expenses	\$17,407.98

CURRENT BALANCE DUE

\$479,594.48

EXHIBIT B
(Proposed Order)

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE 11TH
JUDICIAL CIRCUIT IN AND FOR
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

In re:

COMPLEX BUSINESS LITIGATION
DIVISION

CRYSTAL CRUISES LLC, a California
limited liability company,

Case No. 2022-002742-CA-01
Lead Case

CRYSTAL HOLDINGS U.S., LLC, a
Delaware limited liability company,

Case No. 2022-002757-CA-01

CRYSTAL AIRCRUISES, LLC, a Florida
limited liability company, and

Case No. 2022-002758-CA-01

Assignors,
To:

(Jointly Administered Cases)

MARK C. HEALY,

Assignee.

**ORDER GRANTING MOTION FOR APPROVAL AND PAYMENT
OF FEES AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED
BY BERGER SINGERMAN LLP AS COUNSEL TO THE ASSIGNEE
FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025 [DE ____]**

THIS CAUSE came before the Court upon the *Motion for Approval and Payment of Fees and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred by Berger Singerman LLP as Counsel to the Assignee for the Period October 1, 2024 through April 30, 2025 [DE ____]* (the “Motion”), filed on negative notice by Mark C. Healy (the “Assignee”), solely in his capacity as the Assignee for the benefit of creditors of Crystal Cruises LLC, Crystal Holdings U.S. LLC, and Crystal AirCruises LLC (collectively, the “Assignors”), pursuant to which Berger Singerman LLP seeks compensation in the amount of \$462,186.50 and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$17,407.98, for a total award of \$479,594.48 for the period of October 1, 2024 through April 30, 2025. The Court, having considered the Motion and the record in this proceeding, noting that no objection to the Motion

was filed by any party, finding that notice of the Motion was sufficient, and good cause appearing, it is hereby

ORDERED that:

1. The Motion is **GRANTED**.
2. Berger Singerman, LLP, as counsel to the Assignee, is awarded fees in the amount of \$462,186.50 and expenses in the amount of \$17,407.98, for a total award of \$479,594.48, which represents 100% of the fees and expenses requested in the Motion.
3. The Assignee is authorized to pay to Berger Singerman LLP the sum of \$479,594.48.
4. In making the foregoing award, the Court finds that the amounts awarded represent reasonable compensation for actual and necessary services rendered and expenses incurred by Berger Singerman LLP for the benefit of the assignment estates.

DONE AND ORDERED in Chambers, at Miami-Dade County, Florida on this ___ day of _____, 2025.

HONORABLE LISA S. WALSH
Circuit Court Judge

Copies furnished to:

Counsel of record