

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE 11TH
JUDICIAL CIRCUIT IN AND FOR
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

COMPLEX BUSINESS LITIGATION
DIVISION

In re:

CRYSTAL CRUISES LLC, a California
limited liability company,

Case No. 2022-002742-CA-01
Lead Case

CRYSTAL HOLDINGS U.S., LLC, a
Delaware limited liability company,

Case No. 2022-002757-CA-01

CRYSTAL AIRCRUISES, LLC, a Florida
limited liability company, and

Case No. 2022-002758-CA-01

Assignors,
To:

(Jointly Administered Cases)

MARK C. HEALY,

Assignee.

**MOTION FOR APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF FEES AND
REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED BY BERGER
SINGERMAN LLP, AS COUNSEL TO THE ASSIGNEE FOR THE
PERIOD OF MAY 1, 2025 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2025**

**NOTICE OF OPPORTUNITY TO OBJECT
TO CREDITORS AND OTHER INTERESTED PARTIES:**

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that, pursuant to Fla Stat. § 727.111(4), the Assignee may pay the fees and expenses of professional persons employed by the Assignee as set forth herein, and the Court may consider these actions without further notice or hearing unless a party in interest files an objection within 21 days from the date this paper is served. If you object to the relief requested in this paper, you must file your objection with the Miami-Dade County Clerk of the Court at 73 W. Flagler Street, Room 133, Miami, FL 33130, and serve a copy on the Assignee's counsel, Paul Steven Singerman, Esq. and Samuel Jason Capuano, Esq., Berger Singerman LLP, 1450 Brickell Avenue, Suite 1900, Miami, FL 33131, and any other appropriate person. If you do not file an objection within the time permitted, the Assignee and the Court will presume that you do not oppose the granting of the relief requested in the paper.

BERGER SINGERMAN LLP (“Applicant”), pursuant to Florida Statutes §§ 727.102, 727.109(1), (10) and (15), and § 727.111(4), and the Court’s *Order Granting Assignee’s Motion for Entry of an Order: (1) Approving Noticing Procedures, (2) Approving Proof of Claim Forms; and (3) Extending Deadline to Serve Notice of Assignment* (the “Notice Procedures Order”) entered on March 3, 2022, files this motion (the “Motion”) for approval and payment of fees in the amount of \$544,551.50 and reimbursement of expenses incurred in the amount of \$74,034.81 for a total award of \$618,586.31 in connection with its representation of Mark C. Healy (“Assignee”), in his capacity as the Assignee for the benefit of creditors of Crystal Cruises LLC (“Crystal Cruises”), Crystal Holdings U.S. LLC (“Crystal Holdings”), and Crystal Aircruises LLC (“Crystal Aircruises”, and, together with Crystal Cruises and Crystal Holdings, collectively, the “Assignors”) during the period of May 1, 2025 through September 30, 2025 (the “Application Period”). In support of the Motion, the Applicant states:

1. On February 10, 2022, the Assignor executed and delivered, and the Assignee accepted, irrevocable assignments for the benefit of creditors to the Assignee (collectively, the “Assignments”). On February 11, 2022 (the “Petition Date”), a *Petition Commencing Assignment for the Benefit of Creditors* was filed by the Assignee for each of the Assignors, thereby commencing the following assignment for the benefit of creditors cases pursuant to Section 727 of the Florida Statutes, in this Court: *In re Crystal Cruises LLC*, Case No. 2022-002742-CA-01, *In re Crystal Holdings U.S. LLC*, Case No. 2022-002757-CA-01, and *In re Crystal Aircruises LLC*, Case No. 2022-002758-CA-01 (collectively, the “Assignment Cases”).

2. Prior to the Petition Date, the Assignors were engaged in the travel and entertainment business, including operating ocean, river, and expedition cruises and conducting related activities around the world.

3. Pursuant to Florida Statutes § 727.108(7), the Applicant was retained as co-counsel, along with Nardella & Nardella, by the Assignee to perform all legal activities required for the benefit of the estates.

4. On March 3, 2022, the Court entered an order approving the employment of Applicant as counsel to the Assignee *nunc pro tunc* to February 16, 2022.

5. During the Application Period, the Applicant provided extensive legal services to the Assignee and undertook a wide range of litigation and case management tasks in connection with the claims filed in an amount in excess of \$1 billion by the liquidators of the Assignors' parent company, Genting Hong Kong ("Genting") and certain of its subsidiaries, including discovery coordination, deposition preparation and attendance, motion practice and oral argument, and strategic litigation planning.

6. During the Application Period, the Applicant engaged in complex electronic discovery efforts, managing search terms, document production, drafting and coordinating requests for admission and interrogatories, and communications with opposing counsel. Applicant prepared for and conducted multiple depositions, including those of key witnesses such as Colin Au, Ricardo Celorio, and Jessica Hoppe. These efforts were supported by detailed outlines, exhibit preparation, and post-deposition analysis.

7. Significant time during the Application Period was devoted to drafting and revising dispositive motions, including a comprehensive *Motion for Summary Judgment Against the Claims of Genting Hong Kong Limited, Crystal Acquisition Company Limited, Crystal Luxury Corporation Limited, Star Cruises (HK) Limited, and Star Cruise PTE Ltd.* (DIN 891) seeking to disallow and recharacterize Genting's claims, along with the *Assignee's Notice of Filing Summary Judgment Evidence* (DIN 892).

8. The team also prepared and filed the *Assignee's Motion to Strike Claimants' Expert Disclosure* (DIN 880) and responded to *Claimants' Motion to Amend Case Management Schedule and Memorandum of Law in Support* (DIN 882). These filings required extensive legal research, factual analysis, and coordination among attorneys and the Assignee's team.

9. Significant time during the Application Period was also devoted to drafting and revising a response to Genting's *Motion for Partial Judgment on the Pleadings on the Assignee's Requests for Recharacterization and Equitable Subordination and Memorandum of Law in Support* [DIN 856], as well as preparing and presenting oral argument. This filing and oral argument required extensive research and analysis.

10. Throughout the engagement, Berger Singerman attorneys participated in numerous hearings and interim case management conferences, ensuring the litigation remained on track and aligned with strategic objectives. They also prepared and submitted interim fee applications and supporting documentation, including redacted invoices and proposed orders.

11. During the Application Period, Applicant also provided additional reasonable and necessary services to the Assignment estates including, without limitation, the following:

(a) worked on various pleadings and prepared for and attended related hearings held during the course of these Assignment Cases;

(b) prepared for and attended status calls with the Assignee on a frequent basis with his team to discuss all matters affecting the administration of the Assignors' estates;

(c) reviewed documentation received from creditors, responded to inquiries from creditors, and communicated regularly with Assignee's team regarding same;

(d) engaged in discussions with various creditors and governmental agencies regarding claims and other issues; and

(e) prepared and filed motions for approval of payment of the fees of the Assignee and his professionals, attended the related hearing, and prepared orders granting such motions.

12. This work was essential to advancing the interests of the estate and its creditors, and the firm respectfully requests approval and payment of the fees and expenses incurred.

13. As of September 30, 2025, the cash balance in the estates is \$65,998,185.15 (the “Estate Funds”).

14. The Applicant, as counsel to the Assignee, has incurred fees in the amount of \$544,551.50 for legal services provided to the Assignee during the Application Period as identified in the chart below and expenses in the amount of \$74,034.81 (for a total of \$618,586.31) in the nature of court reporter fees, photocopy charges, e-discovery storage fees, and other expenses. Applicant’s invoice is attached hereto as **Exhibit “A”**. The summary of the fees and expenses incurred are as follows:

SUMMARY OF FEES OF PROFESSIONALS

Partners/Associates & Paraprofessionals	Hours	Rate	Total
Paul Steven Singerman	1.20	\$925.00	\$1,110.00
Ilyse M. Homer	195.00	\$810.00	\$157,950.00
Kenneth W. Waterway	68.00	\$785.00	\$53,380.00
Paul Avron	1.40	\$715.00	\$1,120.00
Samuel J. Capuano	238.70	\$700.00	\$167,090.00
Hunter J. Grasso	256.10	\$525.00	\$134,452.50
Jesse Richman	7.80	\$465.00	\$3,627.00
Mary Joann Hill	12.70	\$425.00	\$5,397.50
Charles Gantz	21.70	\$425.00	\$8,354.50
Carmen Cruz	24.00	\$425.00	\$10,200.00

Partners/Associates & Paraprofessionals	Hours	Rate	Total
Janette Diaz	3.80	\$425.00	\$1,615.00
Kerry Burns	.60	\$425.00	\$255.00
TOTALS	831.00		\$544,551.50

SUMMARY OF EXPENSES INCURRED

Type of Expense	Amount of Expense
Hearing Transcripts	\$3,842.20
E-Discovery Data Storage Fee (\$12 per GB)	\$65,726.04
Reproductions/Photocopies	\$106.95
Parking	\$86.60
Westlaw/Pacer	\$4,273.02
Total Expenses	\$74,034.81

15. Given the nature of these proceedings, and the amount of work that went into representing the Assignee during the Application Period, the Applicant respectfully requests that the Court approve this Application and allow the Applicant an award of fees in the amount of \$544,551.50 and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$74,034.81, for a total of \$618,586.31 for the period of May 1, 2025 through September 30, 2025.

WHEREFORE, the Assignee respectfully requests that this Court enter an Order, in the form attached hereto as **Exhibit “B”**, (i) granting the Motion; (ii) approving the Applicant’s request for compensation for services rendered in the amount of \$544,551.50 and reimbursement of expenses incurred in the amount of \$74,034.81, (iii) authorizing the Assignee to pay the Applicant the sum of \$618,586.31 representing the fees and expenses awarded; and (iv) granting such other and further relief as the Court deems just and proper.

Dated: October 7, 2025

Respectfully submitted,

BERGER SINGERMAN LLP
Co-Counsel for Assignee
1450 Brickell Avenue, Suite 1900
Miami, FL 33131
Telephone: (305) 755-9500

By: /s/ Samuel J. Capuano
Paul Steven Singerman
Florida Bar No. 378860
singerman@bergersingerman.com
Samuel J. Capuano
Florida Bar No. 90946
scapuano@bergersingerman.com

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I HEREBY CERTIFY a true and correct copy of the foregoing was served via the Florida Court's e-Filing Portal on October 7, 2025, to all parties that have entered an appearance in this case; on counsel for the Assignors, Adam Losey, Esq., Losey PLLC, 1420 Edgewater Drive, Orlando, FL 32804, via email to alosey@losey.law; via email to cbl44@jud11.flcourts.org pursuant to CBL Rule 2.2; and via e-mail to all creditors and interested parties on the e-mail service list pursuant to the Notice Procedures Order.

By: /s/ Samuel J. Capuano
Samuel J. Capuano

EXHIBIT A
(Invoices)



201 E. LAS OLAS BLVD. SUITE 1500
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301
T: (954) 525-9900 F: (954) 523-2872
WWW.BERGERSINGERMAN.COM
EIN# 45-3121429

MARK C. HEALY, IN HIS CAPACITY AS ASSIGNEE
FOR THE BENEFIT OF CREDITORS OF CRYSTAL
CRUISES, LLC
841 PRUDENTIAL DRIVE
JACKSONVILLE, FL 32207

October 2, 2025
Invoice: 299825

Client: 30806-0001

Re: ***REPRESENTATION OF ASSIGNEE FOR THE BENEFIT
OF CREDITORS OF CRYSTAL CRUISES LLC***

For professional services rendered thru: ***September 30, 2025***

Total Fees	544,551.50
Total Expenses	74,034.81
Total Balance Due	\$618,586.31

As always, it is our pleasure to work with you! Payment is due upon receipt.

Payments Options:

You may remit payment via check or visit www.bergersingerman.com/info/client-tools/ to pay by eCheck or credit card.

If you wish to remit payment via wire transfer, please refer to the instructions below.

Thank you!

Wiring instructions for Berger Singerman:

Bank:	City National Bank of Florida
Bank Address:	25 W Flagler Street Miami, FL 33130
ABA No.:	066004367
Account Name:	Berger Singerman, LLP Merchant Account
Account No.:	1955119739
Reference Number:	30806-0001



MARK C. HEALY, IN HIS CAPACITY AS
ASSIGNEE FOR THE BENEFIT OF CREDITORS OF
CRYSTAL CRUISES, LLC
841 PRUDENTIAL DRIVE
JACKSONVILLE, FL 32207

INVOICE DATE: October 2, 2025
INVOICE NO. 299825

REPRESENTATION OF ASSIGNEE FOR THE BENEFIT OF
CREDITORS OF CRYSTAL CRUISES LLC

MATTER ID: 30806-0001

PROFESSIONAL LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: September 30, 2025

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
05/01/25	KW	FURTHER EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE POTENTIAL INTERVIEW OF FACT WITNESS HDLR; REVIEW FOR STATUS/STRATEGY UPDATES REGARDING ESI/RFP ISSUES; [REDACTED]	1.40
05/01/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH PI CLAIMANT REGARDING OBJECTION, RESPONSE AND HEARING (.5); REVIEW NEW SEARCH TERM HITS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM AND COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING SAME AND OTHER DISCOVERY MATTERS (.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING VARIOUS DISCOVERY AND STRATEGY MATTERS IN GENTING LITIGATION (.7);	1.90
05/01/25	HJG	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND PREPARE LIST OF SEARCH TERMS IN CONNECTION WITH REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION TO GENTING LIQUIDATORS (3.3); [REDACTED] (1.1); ANALYZE SEARCH TERM RESULTS FOR GENTING LIQUIDATORS' REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION (0.2); PREPARE BULLET POINTS OF AREAS OF INQUIRY (0.3)	4.90
05/02/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS AND EMAILS REGARDING GENTING DISCOVERY AND UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS (.4); [REDACTED] (.2); REVIEW MATERIALS IN SUPPORT OF BERGER SINGERMAN FEE APPLICATION (.9);	1.50

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
05/02/25	KW	[REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND PREPARE INTERNAL MEMO [0.5]; PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN MEET/CONFER WITH GENTING LEGAL TEAM RE CONTINUING DISCOVERY ISSUES [0.5]; [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [0.3]	1.30
05/02/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEET AND CONFER CONFERENCE WITH GENTING COUNSEL REGARDING DOCUMENT REQUESTS, DEPOSITIONS, SEARCH TERMS, AND VARIOUS OTHER DISCOVERY MATTERS (1.0); CONFERENCES, EMAILS, AND OTHER MEETINGS WITH TEAM, ESI TEAM, ASSIGNEE, AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING VARIOUS DISCOVERY ISSUES INCLUDING DOCUMENT REVIEW, SEARCH TERMS, DEPOSITIONS, AND OTHER MATTERS, AND REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED SEARCH TERMS AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS (3.3); RECEIPT OF EMAILS CORRESPONDENCE FROM PI CLAIMANT AND FURTHER COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING OBJECTION, RESPONSE, AND HEARING (.8); REVIEW JURY TRIAL ORDER AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COUNSEL FOR CREDITOR REGARDING SAME AND RELATED MATTERS (.5)	5.60
05/02/25	HJG	[REDACTED] [REDACTED] (1.1); VIDECONFERENCE WITH GENTING LIQUIDATORS REGARDING DISCOVERY MATTERS (0.5)	1.60
05/03/25	KW	REVIEW ADDITIONAL EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE AND INFORMATION RE ESI DISCOVERY ISSUES [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40
05/05/25	KW	PREPARE EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO WITNESS [REDACTED]	0.40
05/05/25	SJC	FINALIZE AND CIRCULATE SEARCH TERM LIST TO COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND MEETINGS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ESI TEAM REGARDING SAME (.9); RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF COUNTER OFFER FROM PI CLAIMANT, CONFERENCE WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME, AND SEND COUNTER OFFER TO PI CLAIMANT (.9); CONFERENCE WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING CLAIMS AND CREDIT CARD RECOVERIES (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING DEPOSITION PREPARATION AND SCHEDULING (.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING CLAIM AND CASE STATUS (.2)	3.00
05/05/25	HJG	REVISE PROPOSED SEARCH TERMS IN CONNECTION	3.10

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		WITH REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION TO GENTING LIQUIDATORS (0.7); [REDACTED] (1.3); RESEARCH REGARDING [REDACTED] (1.1)	
05/07/25	IMH	TEAM EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS REGARDING [REDACTED] AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING SAME	0.40
05/07/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS REGARDING [REDACTED] TO EMAIL; REVIEW COUNSEL EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING CONTINUING ESI DISCOVERY ISSUES	0.30
05/07/25	SJC	REVIEW RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION FROM GENTING AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME AND RELATED MATTERS, AND SEND REQUEST FOR MEET AND CONFER AND CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING OTHER MATTERS TO GENTING COUNSEL (1.3); LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT IN GENTING MATTERS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.7); [REDACTED] (.3);	2.30
05/07/25	HJG	ANALYZE GENTING LIQUIDATORS' RESPONSES AND OBJECTIONS TO ASSIGNEE'S FIRST REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION (0.3); ANALYZE CASE LAW IN CONNECTION WITH MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND ATTENTION TO RELATED MATTERS (2.2)	2.50
05/08/25	IMH	ANALYSIS RELATED TO STRATEGY IN GENTING LITIGATION AND PREPARE NOTES FOR CALL WITH M HEALY REGARDING SAME	0.40
05/08/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS REGARDING DISCOVERY MEET AND CONFER AND, EVOLVING ESI ISSUES	0.40
05/08/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM, TEAM, AND COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING NEW SEARCH TERMS, DEPOSITIONS, MEET AND CONFER, AND VARIOUS OTHER DISCOVERY MATTERS (1.2); CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] (.3)	1.50
05/11/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS UPDATE AND STRATEGY	0.30
05/12/25	IMH	REVIEW CURRENT DRAFT OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED]	2.40
05/12/25	CC	WORK ON REDACTIONS TO INVOICE IN CONNECTION	3.00

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		WITH BSLLP FEE APPLICATION FOR PERIOD 10.1.2024 THROUGH 4.30.2025.	
05/12/25	CC	REVIEW INVOICE FOR APRIL TIME TO ADD TO BSLLP FEE APPLICATION.	0.60
05/12/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS REGARDING PENDING REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL MEET AND CONFER ON DISCOVERY AND ESI ISSUES; REVIEW FOR STATUS RE [REDACTED]	0.40
05/12/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM AND TEAM REGARDING GENTING DISCOVERY MATTERS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR CREDITOR REGARDING STATUS AND CLAIMS (.2)	0.60
05/12/25	HJG	ANALYZE AND REDACT INVOICES FOR FEE APPLICATION	0.50
05/13/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO FEE APPLICATIONS FOR ASSIGNEE PROFESSIONALS (.4); TEAM EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS REGARDING UPDATED STATUS MEMO AND OPEN CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.4);	0.80
05/13/25	CC	WORK ON REDACTIONS TO INVOICE IN CONNECTION WITH BSLLP FEE APPLICATION FOR PERIOD FROM 10.1.2025 THROUGH 4.30.2025.	2.50
05/13/25	CC	WORK ON BSLLP FEE APPLICATION FOR PERIOD FROM 10.1.2024 THROUGH 4.30.2025.	1.00
05/13/25	KW	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH COUNSEL REGARDING FURTHER DEVELOPMENT OF DISCOVERY ISSUES AND [REDACTED]	0.70
05/13/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING GENTING REQUEST TO GENERATE REPORTS AND CIRCULATE PROMPTS AS WELL AS SEARCH TERMS AND OTHER DISCOVERY MATTERS (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING PI CLAIM DISPUTE AND RECEIPT OF COMMUNICATIONS FROM CLAIMANT (.3); REVIEW ORDER EXTENDING DEADLINE FOR UNCLAIMED FUNDS CLAIMANTS AND VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SAME, REVISE FINAL NOTICE TO CLAIM DISTRIBUTIONS, SERVICE OF NOTICE TO UNCLAIMED FUNDS CLAIMANTS, AND RELATED MATTERS (1.0); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR CREDITOR REGARDING CLAIMS AND STATUS (.2)	2.10
05/14/25	IMH	TEAM EMAILS REGARDING SERVICE ISSUES RELATED	1.60

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		TO OPEN CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.2); [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.9); REVIEW CLAIMS REGISTER AND TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THOROUGH REVIEW OF CLAIMS FILED (.5)	
05/14/25	CC	WORK ON BSLLP FEE APPLICATION FOR PERIOD FROM 10.1.2024 THROUGH 4.30.2025.	1.50
05/14/25	CC	UPDATE [REDACTED] E-BINDER.	1.00
05/14/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEET AND CONFER WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING VARIOUS DISCOVERY ISSUES INCLUDING GENTING OBJECTIONS TO REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION, DOCUMENT PRODUCTION, SEARCH TERMS, DEPOSITIONS, AND VARIOUS OTHER MATTERS, AND FOLLOW ON CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.4); CONFERENCE WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING GENTING LITIGATION AND DISCOVERY, CLAIMS ISSUES AND DISTRIBUTIONS, RECOVERY OF FUNDS FROM CREDIT CARD COMPANIES, FEE APPLICATIONS, AND OTHER CASE MATTERS (.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING CLAIMS ISSUES (.5); CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR CREDITOR REGARDING CLAIM AND CASE STATUS (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR COUNSEL REGARDING CLAIM STATUS AND CASE (.2); REVIEW SERVICE DOCUMENTATION FOR FINAL NOTICE TO CLAIM DISTRIBUTIONS AND FINALIZE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE AND FILE (.3)	3.40
05/14/25	HJG	CONFERRAL CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING LIQUIDATORS REGARDING DISCOVERY MATTERS	0.60
05/15/25	KW	CONTINUE REVIEW AND ANALYSIS RE [REDACTED]	0.30
05/15/25	SJC	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF SEARCH TERM HITS FROM COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME, AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING PRODUCTION TO GENTING AND OTHER SEARCH TERM HITS, AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING CUSTODIANS, REVISED TERMS, AND VARIOUS OTHER DISCOVERY MATTERS (1.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING REVIEW OF DOCKET IN CONNECTION WITH CLAIMS RECONCILIATION (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE, COCOUNSEL AND TEAM REGARDING	1.80

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		CREDIT CARD COMPANY RECOVERIES AND FEE APPLICATIONS (.3)	
05/15/25	HJG	ANALYSIS OF MATTERS RELATING TO REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION TO GENTING LIQUIDATORS	1.30
05/16/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES REGARDING NARDELLA AND ASSIGNEE FEE APPLICATIONS (.8); ATTN TO SECOND TIER PRODUCTION INQUIRIES AND [REDACTED] (.4); COMMUNICATE WITH ASSIGNEE'S OFFICE REGARDING MONEY IN THE ESTATES (.2);	1.90
05/16/25	SJC	CONFERENCE CALLS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING DISCOVERY AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AS WELL AS SEARCH TERMS, DYNAMICS REPORTS, AND RELATED DISCOVERY MATTERS IN GENTING LITIGATION (1.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.1)	1.30
05/18/25	JR	COMMUNICATION RE TECHNICAL PRODUCTION SPECIFICATIONS.	0.20
05/19/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES TO ADDRESS PRIOR TO FILING [REDACTED] (.6); PREPARE FOR NEXT HEARING RELATED TO SAME (.5); ATTN TO LIMITED OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO FEE APPLICATIONS OF ASSIGNEE'S PROFESSIONALS (.4); EMAILS WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SAME (.2); TEAM EMAILS REGARDING AMEX SETTLEMENT (.2)	1.90
05/19/25	CC	PREPARE MOTION TO APPROVE PAYMENT OF FEES TO MARK HEALY AND PROPOSED FORM OF ORDER.	1.50
05/19/25	CC	REVIEW OF DOCKET FOR PROOFS OF CLAIM FILED.	1.00
05/19/25	SJC	REVISE, FINALIZE, AND CIRCULATE FEE APPLICATIONS, INTERIM REPORT, ORDERS AND EXHIBITS FOR BSLLP AND ASSIGNEE TO ASSIGNEE AND COCOUNSEL, AND VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.9); CONFERENCE CALLS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING AMEX NEGOTIATIONS AND RECOVERY OF CREDIT CARD RESERVES (.7); REVIEW PROOFS OF CLAIM FILED ON DOCKET IN CONNECTION WITH RECONCILIATION PROJECT AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SAME (.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING GENTING LITIGATION, CLAIMS ISSUES, RECOVERIES, AND VARIOUS OTHER CASE MATTERS (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM AND TEAM REGARDING DISCOVERY PROJECT FOR	4.50

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		GENTING LITIGATION INCLUDING SEARCH TERMS, DOCUMENT PRODUCTION, AND DYNAMICS REPORTS GENERATION (.6)	
05/20/25	IMH	DISCUSSIONS WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING STATUS OF DISCOVERY ISSUES RELATED TO GENTING CLAIM (.4); REVIEW GENTING SCHEDULING ORDER [REDACTED] (.4); TEAM EMAILS REGARDING FINALIZING ALL FEE APPLICATIONS (.2); EMAILS WITH GENTING'S COUNSEL REGARDING STATUS OF AGREED UPON SEARCH TERMS FOR UPCOMING PRODUCTIONS (.2); PREPARE SUMMARY OF STATUS OF ASSIGNMENT CASES FOR COURT (.4);	1.60
05/20/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND TEAM REGARDING DISCOVERY MATTERS INCLUDING PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, SEARCH TERMS, MEET AND CONFER, RESPONSE AND OBJECTIONS, AND VARIOUS RELATED MATTERS (1.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPS (.4)	1.90
05/21/25	IMH	REVIEW FEE APPLICATIONS TO BE FILED BY ASSIGNEE AND HIS PROFESSIONALS WITH UPDATED REDACTIONS FOR GENTING LITGATION BEFORE FILING SAME (.8)	0.80
05/21/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ESI TEAM REGARDING DISCOVERY MATTERS (.3)	0.60
05/22/25	JD	REVIEW, REVISE, FINALIZE WITH EXHIBITS AND FILE (I) MOTION FOR APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF FEES AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED BY BERGER SINGERMAN LLP, AS COUNSEL TO THE ASSIGNEE FOR THE PERIOD OF OCTOBER 1, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025 (.20); AND (II) MOTION FOR APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF FEES OF ASSIGNEE, MARK C. HEALY FOR THE PERIOD OF APRIL 1, 2024 THROUGH MAY 19, 2025 (.20)	0.40
05/22/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM AND ESI TEAM REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES INCLUDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION, REPORT GENERATION AND RELATED MATTERS (.7); FINALIZE AND FILE FEE APPLICATIONS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COCOUNSEL REGARDING SAME AND SERVICE OF SAME (.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING CLAIMS AND CASE STATUS (.2);	1.60
05/23/25	JD	DRAFT, FINALIZE, FORMAT AND FILE NOTICE OF	0.30

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		FILING AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE IN CONNECTION WITH (I) MOTION FOR APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF FEES AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED BY BERGER SINGERMAN LLP, AS COUNSEL TO THE ASSIGNEE FOR THE PERIOD OF OCTOBER 1, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025; AND (II) MOTION FOR APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF FEES OF ASSIGNEE, MARK C. HEALY FOR THE PERIOD OF APRIL 1, 2024 THROUGH MAY 19, 2025	
05/23/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES FOR NEXT WEEK'S CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE	1.10
05/23/25	SJC	REVIEW, FINALIZE AND FILE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE ON FEE APPLICATIONS (.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING DISCOVERY STATUS (.4)	0.50
05/27/25	IMH	FOLLOW UP WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING GENTING PRODUCTION AND ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO [REDACTED]	0.50
05/27/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS RE CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE ON MAY 28, 2025	0.30
05/27/25	SJC	CONFERENCE CALL AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR CREDITOR REGARDING CASE STATUS (.4); PREPARE FOR CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME AND DISCOVERY IN GENTING LITIGATION (1.0)	1.40
05/28/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES FOR TODAY'S CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND DEBRIEF REGARDING SAME (.7); ATTN TO ISSUES IN GENTING RELATED TO TRIAL DEADLINES AND REQUIREMENTS (.4); WORK WITH ESI TEAM ON CURRENT GENTING PRODUCTION AND STRATEGY FOR [REDACTED] (.6); TEAM CALL REGARDING GENTING DEPOSITIONS (.2);	1.90
05/28/25	KW	REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND REAFFIRMATION OF SCHEDULE/DEADLINES ([0.2]); REVIEW FOR STATUS AND UPDATE DISCOVERY STRATEGY WITH LEGAL TEAM (0.3)	0.50
05/28/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE, TEAM, AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SAME, AND REVIEW ORDER ENTERED FOLLOWING HEARING (1.6); PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND MEETINGS	3.20

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		ANALYSIS RELATED TO GENTING'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING RESPONSE TO SAME (.4);	
06/02/25	KW	REVIEW AND ANALYZE GENTING MOTION FOR JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS, INCLUDING RESEARCH AND LEGAL ANALYSIS OF OPPOSITIONAL LAW RE JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS GENERALLY AND MOTIONS FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADING PREPARE BRIEF INTERNAL FILE MEMO	1.60
06/02/25	SJC	REVIEW AND ANALYZE MOTION FOR JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME	0.70
06/02/25	HJG	RESEARCH AND DRAFT RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO GENTING CLAIMANTS' MOTION FOR JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS	5.10
06/03/25	IMH	WORK ON INTRO TO OPPOSITION TO GENTING'S JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS (1.1); TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING SAME (.2)	1.30
06/03/25	SJC	MEETINGS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ESI TEAM REGARDING DISCOVERY MATTERS, DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AND ESI, AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING SAME, DEPOSITIONS, AND OTHER CASE MATTERS (1.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING RESPONSE TO GENTING MOTION FOR JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (.9); CONFERENCE WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING GENTING LITIGATION AND OTHER CASE MATTER (.5).	2.70
06/03/25	JR	[REDACTED]	1.50
06/03/25	HJG	CONTINUE RESEARCHING AND DRAFTING RESPONSE TO LIQUIDATORS' MOTION FOR JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS	5.90
06/04/25	IMH	REVIEW ANALYSIS IN SUPPORT OF RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO GENTING'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS	0.80
06/04/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS FORM GENTING AND BEGIN REVIEW OF DRAFT, AND [REDACTED]	0.80
06/04/25	HJG	COMPLETE INITIAL DRAFT OF RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS	6.20

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
06/05/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.9); WORK WITH ESI TEAM ON LATEST GENTING PRODUCTION INCLUDING TEAM DISCUSSIONS AND EMAILS (.7);	1.60
06/05/25	CMG	DATA DISCOVERY AND PROCESSING OF ASSIGNEE DATA [REDACTED]	4.00
06/05/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ESI TEAM REGARDING DISCOVERY PROCESSING AND PRODUCTION AND RELATED MATTERS IN GENTING MATTER (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS (.8);	1.40
06/05/25	JR	COMMUNICATION RE PROCESSING AND PRODUCTION OF EXPORTED DATA.	0.30
06/05/25	HJG	FURTHER RESEARCH, REVISE, AND SUPPLEMENT RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS	1.40
06/06/25	CMG	DATA DISCOVERY AND PROCESSING OF ASSIGNEE DATA INTO [REDACTED]	8.00
06/06/25	KW	CONTINUED REVIEW/ANALYSIS RE OPPOSITION TO MOTION FOR JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS	0.50
06/09/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS AND EMAILS REGARDING RESPONSE TO JUDGEMENT ON THE PLEADINGS AND ADDITIONAL ARGUMENTS TO INCLUDE IN SAME (.4); PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN TEAM STATUS CALL REGARDING OPEN ISSUES(.8); RESEARCH REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.4)	1.60
06/09/25	CC	PREPARE, FINALIZE AND E-FILE NOTICE OF FILING AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE OF FEE ORDERS.	0.30
06/09/25	CMG	IMAGING OF PROCESSED DATA IN [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	4.00
06/09/25	KW	ANALYZE AND REVISE UPDATED DRAFT OF OPPOSITION TO CLAIMANTS' MOTION FOR JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS	1.30
06/09/25	SJC	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND ANALYSIS OF SAME IN CONNECTION WITH GENTING LITIGATION AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME, MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS, AND MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT (1.0); LEGAL RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND REVIEW	1.80

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		PROPOSED REVISIONS TO SAME FROM OTHER TEAM MEMBERS (.8)	
06/09/25	HJG	REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (3.6); REVISE RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS (0.4); RESEARCH REGARDING [REDACTED] (0.6)	4.60
06/10/25	IMH	WORK WITH ESI TEAM AND CONFER THROUGHOUT THE DAY ON OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO GENTING PRODUCTION (1.2); TEAM DISCUSSIONS AND EMAILS REGARDING PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITIONS SET BY GENTING (.3); STRATEGIZE REGARDING [REDACTED] (.3)	1.80
06/10/25	KW	REVIEW CLAIMANTS' DEPOSITION NOTICES AND UPDATE STATUS/STRATGEY REGARDING DEPOSITIONS AND RELATED DISCOVERY MATTERS	0.90
06/10/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND TEAM REGARDING VARIOUS MATTERS INCLUDING STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION ON BOTH SIDES, DEPOSITION SCHEDULING, THIRD PARTY DISCOVERY, AND OTHER MATTERS, AND REVIEW SUBPOENAS AND DEPOSITION NOTICES (1.3); REVIEW ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS AND ANALYSIS OF SAME IN CONNECTION WITH GENTING LITIGATION AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.9); CONFERENCE WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING CLAIMS ISSUES, GENTING LITIGATION, AND OTHER CASE ISSUES (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ESI TEAM REGARDING GENTING DISCOVERY MATTERS (.3)	2.90
06/10/25	HJG	CONTINUE REVIEWING DOCUMENTS IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT	1.50
06/11/25	SJC	REVISE RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS, LEGAL RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH SAME, COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM IN CONNECTION WITH SAME, AND CIRCULATE REVISED DRAFT TO TEAM	5.10
06/12/25	IMH	REVIEW RESPONSE TO GENTING'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS AS IT RELATES TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING SAME (.8); PREPARE STATUS MEMO FOR ASSIGNEE REGARDING OPEN ISSUES ON CLAIMS (.3)	1.10
06/12/25	CC	WORK ON PROPOSED ORDERS GRANTING FEE APPLICATION OF BERGER SINGERMAN AND MARK HEALY.	0.60

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
06/12/25	CMG	QC IMAGE ERRORS IN RELATIVITY WORKSPACE BEFORE PRODUCTION IS EXPORTED	1.00
06/12/25	SJC	CONTINUE REVISING RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME AND LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING SAME, AND CIRCULATE DRAFT OF SAME TO ASSIGNEE (2.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.1)	2.30
06/12/25	HJG	REVISE RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS	0.80
06/13/25	IMH	CONTINUED WORK WITH ESI TEAM REGARDING OUTSTANDING PRODUCTION TO GENTING	1.00
06/13/25	CMG	PREPARATION OF ELECTRONIC DOCUMENT PRODUCTION	2.00
06/13/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ESI TEAM AND WORK WITH ESI TEAM TO FINALIZE VARIOUS PRODUCTIONS TO GENTING (.8); CONTINUE WORKING ON RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME AND LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (1.7); FINALIZE AND SUBMIT ORDERS ON FEE APPLICATIONS AND COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING SAME (.4); COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING [REDACTED] (.3)	3.20
06/13/25	JR	RUN OF PROD004 PRODUCTION VOLUME, MONITORING OF PRODUCTION PROGRESS, COMMUNICATION RE SAME.	2.00
06/16/25	IMH	REVIEW COURT ORDERS ENTERED TODAY AND FOLLOW UP WITH ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING SAME	0.20
06/16/25	CMG	EXPORT PRODUCTION SET FROM RELATIVITY	0.40
06/16/25	SJC	CONFERENCE WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING GENTING LITIGATION, DISCOVERY, AND RELATED MATTERS (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ESI TEAM REGARDING EDISCOVERY ISSUES (.4); REVIEW FEE ORDERS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING [REDACTED] AND OTHER CASE MATTERS (.5)	1.50
06/17/25	IMH	UPDATE ANALYSIS WITH ESI TEAM ON GENTING PRODUCTION AND TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING TIMING AND OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO SAME (.4); TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING HEARINGS ON	1.60

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS FOR GENTING CLAIM AND PREPARE MATERIALS RELATED TO SAME (1.2)	
06/17/25	CMG	PREPARATION OF ADDITIONAL ELECTRONIC DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS	1.00
06/17/25	CMG	UPLOAD AND ZIP PRODUCTION EXPORTS FOR DATA TRANSFER	1.00
06/17/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM, ESI TEAM, AND COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING DISCOVERY MATTERS AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION	0.60
06/17/25	JR	ARCHIVE AND MONITORING OF PROGRESS OF PROD004 PRODUCTION DELIVERABLE, COMMUNICATION RE SAME.	0.70
06/18/25	CC	PREPARE, FINALIZE AND E-FILE NOTICE OF FILING AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE OF FEE ORDERS.	0.30
06/18/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND DEPOSITIONS SCHEDULING (.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH GENTING COUNSEL TO DELIVER LINKS TO VARIOUS DISCOVERY PRODUCTIONS AND COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING SAME, DEPOSITION SCHEDULING, THIRD PARTY DISCOVERY, PRODUCTION TO ASSIGNEE, AND VARIOUS OTHER CASE MATTERS, AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM, ESI TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (1.1)	1.50
06/18/25	JR	GENERATION OF LINK AND RELEASE OF PROD004 PRODUCTION DELIVERABLE.	0.40
06/19/25	IMH	TEAM EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS REGARDING STATUS OF PRODUCTION, DEPOSITIONS AND OTHER DISCOVERY IN GENTING LITIGATION (.5); [REDACTED] (.7)	1.20
06/19/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS/STRATEGY RE DEPOSITION PREPARATION	0.30
06/19/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND GENTING COUNSEL REGARDING VARIOUS GENTING DISCOVERY MATTERS INCLUDING DEPOSITION SCHEDULING AND PREPARATION, LOGISTICS, THIRD PARTY DISCOVERY, AND OTHER CASE MATTERS (1.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING [REDACTED] (.2); CONFERENCE CALL AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] REGARDING THIRD PARTY SUBPOENA AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (.5)	1.80

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
06/20/25	IMH	WORK ON QUESTION SETS FOR UPCOMING DESPOSITIONS IN GENTING LITIGATION	2.10
06/20/25	SJC	CONFERENCE CALLS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS (.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING DEPOSITION SCHEDULING AND DISCOVERY MATTERS (.5)	1.40
06/22/25	IMH	REVIEW COMMENTS TO OPPOSITION TO GENTING'S MOTION FOR JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND AND ANALYSIS AND TEAM EMAILS REGARDING SAME	1.80
06/22/25	SJC	CONTINUE WORKING ON RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME	1.10
06/23/25	IMH	RESEARCH REGARDING [REDACTED] (8); REVISE MATERIALS FOR HEARING ON SAME (.4); REVIEW DOCKETS AND REPORTS REGARDING CLAIMS OBJECTIONS AND PENDING ORDERS PERTAINING TO SAME (1.0); FOLLOW UP REGARDING UPCOMING CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCES AND REVIEW COURT'S GUIDELINES RELATED TO SAME (.3);	2.50
06/23/25	CC	FINALIZE AND E-FILE RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO CLAIMANTS' MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS.	0.40
06/23/25	KW	FURTHER ATTENTION TO STATUS/STRATEGY RE DEPOSITIONS AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS	0.60
06/23/25	KW	REVIEW/REVISE FINAL DRAFT OF OPPOSITION TO CLAIMANTS' MOTION FOR "PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS"	0.50
06/23/25	SJC	REVISE, CONTINUE REVISING, FINALIZE, AND FILE RESPONSE TO GENTING'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.2); MEETINGS AND OTHER COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING GENTING DISPOSITIVE MOTIONS, DISCOVERY, DEPOSITIONS, AND VARIOUS OTHER CASE MATTERS (1.0); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING DISCOVERY MATTERS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITORS REGARDING STATUS AND CLAIMS (.5)	2.90
06/23/25	HJG	FURTHER REVISE AND FINALIZE RESPONSE TO GENTING LIQUIDATORS' MOTION FOR PARTIAL	1.50

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS	
06/24/25	IMH	WORK ON OUTLINES FOR UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS IN GENTING LITIGATION (2.0); STRATEGIZE WITH TEAM REGARDING FILING OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED] (.3)	2.30
06/24/25	KW	REVIEW UPDATED DRAFT OF MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT	0.30
06/24/25	SJC	CONTINUE REVISING AND CIRCULATE MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED] AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING SAME (.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITIONS IN GENTING MATTER (.4)	1.30
06/24/25	HJG	RESEARCH REGARDING [REDACTED]	0.50
06/25/25	IMH	TEAM MEETINGS AND DISCUSSIONS THROUGHOUT THE DAY REGARDING GENTING DISCOVERY AND UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS (.9); ANALYSIS RELATED TO [REDACTED] (1.5)	2.40
06/25/25	CC	UPDATE GENTING CLAIM E-BINDER.	0.60
06/25/25	KW	REVIEW STATUS AND UPDATE STRATEGY RE [REDACTED]	0.50
06/25/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH TEAM REGARDING DEPOSITIONS, DISCOVERY, DISPOSITIVE MOTION PRACTICE, AND OTHER MATTERS, AND RELATED EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS (1.0); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING EXTENSION OF DISCOVERY DEADLINES, DEPOSITION SCHEDULING, DOCUMENT PRODUCTION, AND OTHER MATTERS (.5)	1.50
06/25/25	HJG	STRATEGIZE REGARDING UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS	0.60
06/26/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES REGARDING UPCOMING CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.4); COMMUNICATE REGARDING SCOPE OF UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS IN GENTING CASE (.4)	0.80
06/26/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS AND STRATEGY RE DEPOSITION PREPARATION	0.40
06/26/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING C AU DEPOSITION NOTICE AND RELATED MATTERS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (.2)	0.40
06/26/25	HJG	RESEARCH REGARDING [REDACTED]	0.20

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
06/27/25	IMH	ATTN TO AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS TO BE USED AT UPCOMING GENTING DEPOSITIONS AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING ██████████	1.40
06/27/25	CC	PREPARE, FINALIZE AND E-FILE NOTICE OF TAKING DEPOSITION OF COLIN AU.	0.60
06/27/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.6); RECEIPT OF DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FROM GENTING AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH ESI TEAM REGARDING SAME (.7); FINALIZE AND FILE NOTICE OF DEPOSITION OF COLIN AU AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME, PREPARATION, AND LOGISTICS, AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS (1.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND TEAM REGARDING DEPOSITIONS, THIRD PARTY DISCOVERY, DISPOSITIVE MOTIONS, AND VARIOUS RELATED CASE MATTERS (.9)	3.70
06/27/25	HJG	BEGIN PREPARING FOR DEPOSITION OF C. AU	2.70
06/27/25	MH	BEGIN DOWNLOAD OF VOLUMINOUS GHK PRODUCTION DATA.	0.50
06/28/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS AND EMAILS REGARDING REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY GENTING (.4); ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO UPCOMING CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.2)	0.60
06/30/25	IMH	STRATEGIZE REGARDING DEPOSITION OF AU (.3); ATTN TO DELIVERABLES FROM TODAY'S CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.2); FOLLOW UP WITH ESI TEAM REGARDING GENTING'S RECENT PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS (.7); TEAM EMAILS REGARDING SCOPE OF UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS (.2)	1.40
06/30/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS AND ██████████	0.50
06/30/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.8); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ESI TEAM AND ASSIGNEE'S TEAM REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION MATTERS (.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING VARIOUS DEPOSITION MATTERS AND PREP (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING DISPOSITIVE MOTIONS (.1)	2.90
06/30/25	JR	COORDINATION OF DOWNLOAD, STAGE AND PROCESS OF ADDITIONAL CLIENT DATA FOR ANTICIPATED SUPPLEMENTAL PRODUCTION.	0.30
06/30/25	HJG	CONTINUE PREPARING OUTLINE OF QUESTIONS FOR DEPOSITION OF C. AU	3.40

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
06/30/25	MH	EXTRACT GHK PRODUCTION DATA FOR IMPORT INTO RELATIVITY.	0.80
06/30/25	MH	RE-DOWNLOAD GHK DATA DUE TO EXTRACTION ERRORS.	0.50
07/01/25	IMH	WORK WITH ESI TEAM ON ANALYSIS OF GENTING PRODUCTION (.8); ATTN TO OPEN INQUIRIES REGARDING UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS (.7); ATTN TO MOTION FOR PROTECTION FROM KPMG AND PWC (.3)	1.80
07/01/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS RE DEPOSITION PREPARATION, DOCUMENT PRODUCTION; PRELIMINARY REVIEW OF GENTING PRODUCTION OF KPMG AND PWC DOCS	0.70
07/01/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH ██████ REGARDING GENTING LITIGATION AND RELATED EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND ESI TEAM REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FROM GENTING, DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FROM KPMG AND PWC, AND DYNAMICS REPORTS PRODUCTION TO GENTING (.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING DEPOSITION PREPARATION (.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR CREDITOR REGARDING CASE STATUS (.2)	2.00
07/01/25	JR	COMMUNICATION RE STATUS OF DATA PROCESSING.	0.30
07/01/25	HJG	CONTINUE DRAFTING OUTLINE OF QUESTIONS FOR C. AU DEPOSITION (3.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND IDENTIFY EXHIBITS FOR USE AT DEPOSITION (2.5)	5.70
07/01/25	MH	CURSORY REVIEW OF GHK PRODUCTION DATA AND ERRORS RELATING TO ZIP FILE.	0.40
07/01/25	MH	RE-DOWNLOAD GHK PRODUCTION DATA TO ADDRESS ZIP FILE ERRORS.	0.60
07/01/25	MH	DOWNLOAD/EXTRACT KPMG AND PCW NON-PARTY PRODUCTION DATA.	0.20
07/02/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING ISSUES RELATED TO DOCUMENT REVIEW (.6); ANALYSIS OF OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO DEPO PREP INCLUDING TEAMS CALL REGARDING SAME (.9)	0.90
07/02/25	CC	OBTAIN ZOOM INFORMATION AND CREATE CALENDAR INVITES FOR PARTICIPANTS IN THE DEPOSITIONS OF COLIN AU AND JACK ANDERSON.	0.40
07/02/25	CMG	EXPORT DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FROM RELATIVITY DATABASE; CREATE SHAREFILE LINK FOR DATA TRANSMITTAL	0.30
07/02/25	KW	REVIEW STATUS OF DEPOSITION PREPARATION AND	1.00

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		MEET WITH LEGAL TEAM REGARDING FINAL PREPARATION AND DEPOSITION EXHIBITS	
07/02/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR COLIN AU DEPOSITION AND VARIOUS ZOOM CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME, AND WORK ON OUTLINE AND EXHIBITS (3.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND ESI TEAM REGARDING PRODUCTION ERRORS AND VARIOUS OTHER DISCOVERY MATTERS INCLUDING DEPOSITION MATTERS, AND PRODUCE ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS, AND COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING THIRD PARTY DISCOVERY (1.3)	4.50
07/02/25	JR	PREPRODUCTION AND PRODUCTION OF ASSIGNEE 007.	0.80
07/02/25	HJG	REVIEW THIRD PARTY DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY PWC AND KPMG (2.1); STRATEGIZE REGARDING DEPOSITION OF C. AU AND OTHERS (1.1); CONTINUE DRAFTING C. AU DEPOSITION OUTLINE (2.8)	6.00
07/02/25	MH	IMPORT/PROCESS KPMG NON-PARTY PRODUCTION DATA; PREPARE IMPORT SPECS RE: SAME.	0.50
07/02/25	MH	IMPORT/PROCESS PRICEWATERHOUSECOOPERS DATA INTO RELATIVITY; PREPARE IMPORT SPECS RE: SAME.	0.90
07/02/25	MH	REVIEW/RESPOND TO EMAILS TO/FROM P. FITZMAURICE RE: ISSUES WITH CLAIMANTS' DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.	0.10
07/03/25	IMH	REVISE QUESTION SETS FOR UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS RELATED TO GENTING CLAIM (.9); TEAM EMAILS REGARDING OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (.3)	1.20
07/03/25	KW	CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL TEAM RE PREPARATION FOR AU DEPOSITION, DEPOSITION EXHIBITS (0.6); REVIEW UPDATED DRAFT OF DEPOSITION OUTLINE (0.2)	0.80
07/03/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR COLIN AU DEPOSITION, INCLUDING OUTLINE AND EXHIBITS, AND CONFERENCES WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING SAME (7.2); REVIEW REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS FILED BY GENTING AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING SAME (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ESI TEAM AND GENTING ESI TEAM REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION ISSUES (.2)	8.00
07/03/25	HJG	ANALYZE GENTING CLAIM INVOICES AND AMOUNTS (1.1); IDENTIFY ADDITIONAL EXHIBITS FOR	3.30

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		DEPOSITION OF C. AU AND REVISE DEPOSITION OUTLINE (2.2)	
07/04/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND TEAM REGARDING COLIN AU DEPOSITION	0.50
07/04/25	MH	BEGIN DOWNLOAD OF REVISED, VOLUMINOUS GHK PRODUCTION DATA (29 VOLUMES OF 4GB DATA).	2.00
07/05/25	IMH	STRATEGIZE AND REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING [REDACTED] (4); DISCUSSIONS REGARDING UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS IN GENTING (.3)	0.70
07/05/25	KW	FURTHER REVIEW REGARDING AU DEPOSITION OUTLINE AND EXHIBITS	0.80
07/05/25	MH	CONTINUED DOWNLOAD/MONITORING OF VOLUMINOUS GHK PRODUCTION DATA.	2.00
07/06/25	KW	ATTEND AU DEPOSITION	3.00
07/06/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND TAKE DEPOSITION OF COLIN AU AND CONFERENCE CALLS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME	9.00
07/06/25	HJG	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND DEPOSITION OF C. AU	3.80
07/06/25	MH	FINALIZED DOWNLOAD OF VOLUMINOUS GHK PRODUCTION DATA; EXTRACTION OF GHK PRODUCTION DATA.	2.00
07/07/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES FOLLOWING C AU DEPOSITION AS THEY RELATE TO UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS OF OTHER DEPENDENTS (1.2); COMMUNICATE WITH ESI TEAM REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (.2); TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING HEARING ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION IN GENTING (.3); REVISE MATERIALS RELATED TO SAME (.4)	2.10
07/07/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS/STRATEGY RE HEARING ON GENTING MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS	0.20
07/07/25	SJC	MEETINGS WITH TEAM TO PREPARE FOR J ANDERSON DEPOSITION AND BEGIN WORKING ON SAME (1.6); CONFERENCE CALLS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM, ASSIGNEE, AND COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING COLIN AU DEPOSITION, EXHIBITS FOR COLIN AU DEPOSITION, AND HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS (.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FROM GENTING (.5)	3.00
07/07/25	HJG	BEGIN PREPARING OUTLINE FOR DEPOSITION OF J. ANDERSON	0.80

F E E S

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
07/07/25	MH	RELATIVITY DATA STAGING OF VOLUMINOUS GHK PRODUCTION DATA. [1.0 NO CHARGE]	0.00	N/C
07/07/25	MH	IMPORT/PROCESS VOLUMINOUS GHK PRODUCTION DATA INTO RELATIVITY.	1.50	
07/07/25	MH	TROUBLESHOOT DATE FORMATTING ISSUES IN GHK PRODUCTION DATA; MULTIPLE ATTEMPTS AT REFORMATTING DATE FIELDS IN LOAD FILE; MULTIPLE IMPORT ATTEMPTS. [2.0 NO CHARGE]	0.00	N/C
07/08/25	IMH	DISCUSSIONS REGARDING FIRST TIER REVIEW OF GENTING DOCUMENTS AND NEXT STEPS (.4); STRATEGIZE REGARDING HEARING ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT (.4); [REDACTED] (.3); TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING 7/10 DEPOSITION OF ANDERSON AND CANCELLATION OF SAME (.3)	1.40	
07/08/25	KW	REVIEW STATUS AND UPDATE STRATEGY RE ANDERSON DEPOSITION AND [REDACTED]	0.40	
07/08/25	SJC	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM GENTING AND MEETINGS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.1); CONTINUE PREPARING FOR J ANDERSON DEPOSITION (1.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND HEARING (.4); REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO EXTEND DEADLINE TO TAKE DEPOSITIONS AND PROPOSED ORDER IN GENTING LITIGATION AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING SAME (.6)	3.70	
07/08/25	HJG	ANALYZE DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY GENTING LIQUIDATORS	1.90	
07/09/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS/STRATEGY RE [REDACTED]	0.20	
07/09/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR ORAL ARGUMENT ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS, AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM, ASSIGNEE, AND COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING SAME AND RELATED MATTERS (2.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING DISCOVERY MATTERS IN GENTING LITIGATION (.6); REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT OF C AU AND SUMMARIZE AND ANNOTATE SAME (1.2)	3.90	
07/09/25	HJG	CONTINUE ANALYZING DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY GENTING LIQUIDATORS	1.20	

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
07/10/25	IMH	TEAM EMAILS REGARDING UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS (.2); TEAM EMAILS AND COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING HEARING ON MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT (.3); REVIEW ADDITIONAL MATERIALS RELATED TO SAME (.3);	0.80
07/10/25	KW	DRAFT PROPOSED INTERROGATORIES REGARDING [REDACTED]	0.80
07/10/25	SJC	REVIEW AND REVISE FIRST SET OF INTERROGATORIES AND REQUEST FOR ADMISSION AGAINST GENTING AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.0); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING, ASSIGNEE, AND CHAMBERS REGARDING HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND CONTINUE PREPARING FOR SAME (1.6)	2.60
07/10/25	HJG	DRAFT FIRST REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES AND FIRST REQUEST FOR ADMISSIONS TO GENTING LIQUIDATORS	1.10
07/11/25	KLB	REVISE AND FINALIZE FIRST REQUEST FOR ADMISSIONS, FIRST SET OF INTERROGATORIES AND EMAILS TO S. CAPUANO (.3); FORMAT AND E-FILE DISCOVERY REQUESTS AND PREPARE FOR SERVICE BY EMAIL TO COUNSEL FOR GENTING LIQUIDATORS (.3)	0.60
07/11/25	KW	REVIEW FINAL DRAFTS OF INTERROGATORIES / REQUEST FOR ADMISSIONS TO GENTING	0.50
07/11/25	SJC	CONTINUE REVISING, FINALIZE AND FILE FIRST REQUEST FOR ADMISSIONS AND FIRST SET OF INTERROGATORIES ON GENTING AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR CREDITOR REGARDING CASE STATUS (.2)	1.40
07/13/25	IMH	PREPARE AND ANALYZE MATERIALS FOR HEARING ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT ON OBJECTION TO GENTING'S CLAIM	2.00
07/14/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS AND EMAILS THROUGHOUT THE DAY REGARDING UPCOMING DEPOSITION IN GENTING AND HEARING ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT (.9); PREPARE FOR HANDS ON CALL WITH ASSIGNEE AND PROFESSIONALS (.3); PARTICIPATE IN SAME AND ATTN TO FOLLOW UP ISSUES (.7)	1.90
07/14/25	SJC	CONTINUE PREPARING FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND MEETINGS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME AND REVIEW NOTICE OF	2.90

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		HEARING (1.1); PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND TEAM CONFERENCE WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM (.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING COMMERCIAL CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND PREPARE EMAIL TO CLAIMANT COUNSEL (.9)	
07/14/25	HJG	CONTINUE REVIEWING DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY GENTING LIQUIDATORS (1.7); REVISE AND SUPPLEMENT MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT ON [REDACTED] (3.1); BEGIN PREPARING CASE SUMMARIES FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS (3.0)	7.80
07/15/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR HEARING ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT OF GENTING CLAIM OBJECTION (2.2); REVIEW [REDACTED] (1.3);	3.50
07/15/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND CONTINUE PREPARATION	0.80
07/15/25	HJG	CONTINUE PREPARING CASE SUMMARIES FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS (2.7); RESEARCH REGARDING [REDACTED] (1.7)	4.40
07/16/25	IMH	RESEARCH IN SUPPORT OF [REDACTED] (2.1); TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING SAME (.3); STRATEGIZE REGARDING [REDACTED] (.2)	2.60
07/16/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS AND UPDATE STRATEGY RE DOCUMENTS, HEARING PREPARATION	0.50
07/16/25	SJC	CONFERENCE CALLS AND MEETINGS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND CONTINUE PREPARING FOR SAME, AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM GENTING AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME	2.10
07/16/25	HJG	CONTINUED REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY GENTING LIQUIDATORS (4.1); STRATEGIZE REGARDING HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS (0.7); RESEARCH AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING DISPOSITIVE MOTION PRACTICE (0.8)	5.70
07/17/25	IMH	ANALYSIS IN SUPPORT OF COURT PRESENTATION ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT RELATED TO GENTING'S	2.20

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		CLAIMS AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING MATERIALS FOR SAME (2); REVIEW [REDACTED] (.2)	
07/17/25	HJG	RESEARCH AND DRAFT [REDACTED] (2.1); CONTINUE REVIEWING DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY GENTING LIQUIDATORS (1.9)	4.00
07/18/25	JD	CREATE E-BINDER FOR UPCOMING HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT ON JULY 23RD	0.60
07/18/25	IMH	REVIEW GENTING HEARING OUTLINE (.5)	0.50
07/18/25	SJC	CONTINUE PREPARING FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS INCLUDING PREPARATION OF HEARING OUTLINE AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME	4.50
07/21/25	PSS	INTEROFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. CAPUANO RE STATUS AND STRATEGY FOR 7/23 HEARINGS	0.30
07/21/25	JD	CREATE E-BINDER CONTAINING CASES CITED IN GENTING'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT; RESPONSE TO MOTION AND REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION	2.50
07/21/25	IMH	ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RELATED TO 7/23 SUMMARY JUDGMENT HEARING (1.8); STRATEGIZE WITH TEAM AND DISCUSSIONS THROUGHOUT THE DAY REGARDING SAME (.8); ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO DEPOSITION SUMMARIES IN GENTING LITIGATION (.2);	2.80
07/21/25	PA	RESEARCH RE [REDACTED] AND DRAFT FOLLOW-UP MEMO	1.40
07/21/25	KW	FURTHER ASSESS HEARING STRATEGY WITH LEGAL TEAM	0.40
07/21/25	KW	REVIEW MEMO RE [REDACTED]	0.60
07/21/25	SJC	CONTINUE PREPARING FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS INCLUDING WORKING ON HEARING OUTLINE AND MEETINGS, EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (5.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING [REDACTED] (.6)	5.70

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
07/21/25	HJG	ANALYZE ARGUMENT OUTLINE FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS	0.40
07/22/25	IMH	RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS OF ██████████ TO POTENTIALLY USE IN ORAL ARGUMENT IN SUPPORT OF OPPOSITION TO SUMMARY JUDGMENT (2.2); REVIEW PRESENTATION MATERIALS AND REVISE SAME (.5); ANALYSIS OF LAW ON ██████████ (1.1)	3.80
07/22/25	CC	ASSIST WITH E-BINDER PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT.	0.60
07/22/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS, STRATEGY RE CONTINUING HEARING PREPARATION	0.40
07/22/25	SJC	CONTINUE PREPARING FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND VARIOUS CONFERENCES CALLS AND EMAILS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME AND RELATED MATTERS, AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING, COUNSEL FOR CREDITORS, CHAMBERS AND TEAM REGARDING IN-PERSON HEARING AND PREPARATION OF HEARING BINDERS FOR SAME AND REVIEW AMENDED NOTICE OF HEARING	6.80
07/22/25	HJG	CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT REGARDING ██████████ (1.6); ANALYZE ██████████ (2.4); REVISE CASE SUMMARIES FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS (1.0)	4.90
07/23/25	PSS	INTEROFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. CAPUANO RE STATUS AND STRATEGY AND HEARING PREPARATION AND THEN FOLLOW UP INTEROFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. CAPUANO RE DEBRIEF OF HEARING	0.40
07/23/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES REGARDING HEARING PREPARATION (2.2); DEBRIEF WITH TEAM FOLLOWING SAME (.2); ANALYSIS OF ██████████ (1.8);	4.20
07/23/25	CC	CONFER WITH OUELLETTE & MAULDIN RE ORDERING TRANSCRIPT OF HEARING ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS FILED BY GENTING.	0.20
07/23/25	CC	PREPARE ORDER DENYING GENTING'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS.	0.30

F E E S

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
07/23/25	CC	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF E-BINDERS FOR HEARING ON GENTING'S MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS.	0.60
07/23/25	CC	UPDATE GENTING OBJECTION TO CLAIM E-BINDER.	1.00
07/23/25	KW	ATTEND HEARING ON GENTING MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS; REVIEW PROPOSED ORDER	1.50
07/23/25	SJC	CONTINUE PREPARING FOR AND ATTEND IN-PERSON HEARING ON GENTING MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS, AND VARIOUS MEETINGS, CONFERENCE CALLS, AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING SAME (5.8); REVISE AND CIRCULATE INTERNALLY PROPOSED ORDER ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS (.3)	6.10
07/23/25	HJG	STRATEGIZE REGARDING ██████████ FOLLOWING DENIAL OF MOTION FOR JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS	0.40
07/24/25	IMH	FOLLOW UP WITH GENTING'S COUNSEL REGARDING ORDER FROM YESTERDAY'S HEARING (.2); ANALYSIS OF ██████████ (1.6);	1.80
07/24/25	SJC	FINALIZE AND SUBMIT ORDER ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND REGARDING SAME (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR CREDITOR REGARDING STATUS (.2)	0.80
07/25/25	SJC	REVIEW ORDER ON MOTION FOR PARTIAL JUDGMENT ON PLEADINGS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND CREDITOR COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING GENTING LITIGATION (.3)	0.50
07/26/25	IMH	TEAM EMAILS AND REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS REGARDING EXPERT DISCLOSURE IN GENTING LITIGATION (.3); ATTN TO ISSUES REGARDING FILING OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION ██████████ (1.6);	1.10
07/26/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS/STRATEGY RE ██████████	0.30
07/26/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING LITIGATION STRATEGY IN GENTING MATTER	0.40
07/28/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR UPCOMING STATUS CONFERENCE (.8);	4.60

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		ANALYSIS AND RESEARCH RELATED TO OPEN ISSUES FROM GENTING SCHEDULING ORDER (1.6); BEGIN ANALYSIS OF EVIDENCE [REDACTED] AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING SAME (2.2)	
07/28/25	KW	REVIEW DRAFT OF UPDATED SUMMARY JUDGMENT ARGUMENTS	0.30
07/28/25	SJC	CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR CREDITOR REGARDING STATUS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING STRATEGY AND SUMMARY JUDGMENT IN GENTING LITIGATION AND REVIEW DRAFTS (.5);	0.70
07/28/25	HJG	CONTINUE REVIEWING DOCUMENTS AND REVISING AND SUPPLEMENTING MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED]	3.50
07/29/25	IMH	REVIEW AND REVISE [REDACTED]	1.30
07/29/25	KW	FURTHER REVIEW AND ANALYSIS RE DEVELOPMENT OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT ARGUMENTS	0.50
07/29/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR INTERIM CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING SAME	0.50
07/29/25	HJG	CONTINUE REVISING MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT	0.60
07/30/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO TODAY'S STATUS CONFERENCE (.9); ATTN TO ADMINISTRATIVE MATTERS INCLUDING WORK ON NEXT FEE APPLICATION INCLUDING REDACTIONS TO DATE (1.6); REVIEW NEXT DRAFT OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING FILING SAME (.9)	3.40
07/30/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (1.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING GENTING LITIGATION AND STRATEGY (.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING MONEYSHOW CLAIM (.2)	2.30
08/01/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO FEE APPLICATIONS FOR ASSIGNEE'S PROFESSIONALS (1)	1.00
08/01/25	CC	CORRESPOND WITH R. GAMBOA RE STATUS OF CLAIM.	0.20
08/01/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING	0.90

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		CREDITOR INQUIRIES (.3) COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTIONS IN GENTING LITIGATION AND RELATED MATTERS (.6)	
08/05/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS OF ASSIGNEE'S PROFESSIONALS (1.2); RESEARCH IN SUPPORT OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED] (2)	3.20
08/06/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES REGARDING REVIEW AND MIGRATION OF DOCUMENTS RELATED TO GENTING LITIGATION AND WORK WITH EDISCOVERY TEAM ON OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO SAME (2); MEMO REGARDING OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO GENTING PRODUCTION (.8);	2.80
08/06/25	SJC	CONFERENCE CALL AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MATTERS, STRATEGY, DEPOSITIONS, AND OTHER CASE MATTERS (.8); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING CLAIMS AND CASE STATUS (.2)	1.00
08/06/25	HJG	REVISE AND SUPPLEMENT MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED] (1.6); STRATEGIZE REGARDING [REDACTED] (0.4); BEGIN DRAFTING MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED] (2.8)	4.80
08/06/25	MH	COMPILE INFORMATION FOR [REDACTED]	0.20
08/07/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR STANDING TEAM CALL WITH ASSIGNEE (.3); EMAILS WITH M HEALY REGARDING SAME (.1); RESEARCH IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED] (3); FOLLOW UP REGARDING STATUS OF ANSWERS TO ADMISSION REQUESTS AND INTERROGATORIES (.2);	3.60
08/07/25	CC	UPDATE GENTING OBJECTION E-BINDER.	0.40
08/07/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH COCOUNSEL REGARDING [REDACTED] AND WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING CASE STATUS	0.40
08/08/25	IMH	REVIEW GENTING DOCUMENTS ON NEW ESI PLATFORM AND STRATEGIZE WITH TEAM REGARDING OPEN ISSUES (.8); REVISE MATERIALS FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT HEARING IN GENTING AND ANALYZE CASES IN SUPPORT OF SAME (1.5);	2.30

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
08/08/25	CC	UPDATE GENTING OBJECTION E-BINDER.	0.30
08/08/25	HJG	CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED] (2.5); DRAFT EX PARTE MOTION FOR ENTRY OF AN ORDER [REDACTED] (1.0)	3.50
08/11/25	IMH	ATTN TO OPEN ISSUES REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AND ANALYSIS FOR GENTING (2.3); ANALYSIS AND TEAM DISCUSSIONS IN SUPPORT OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION [REDACTED] (1.8); STRATEGIZE REGARDING [REDACTED] (4); FOLLOW UP REGARDING ADDITIONAL DEPOSITIONS TO BE TAKEN (.2);	4.70
08/11/25	HJG	FINALIZE INITIAL DRAFT OF MOTION FOR ENTRY OF AN ORDER SUSTAINING OMNIBUS OBJECTION (0.5); CONTINUE DRAFTING MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED] (3.3); FURTHER REVISE MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT REGARDING [REDACTED] (0.6)	4.40
08/12/25	IMH	STRATEGIZE REGARDING [REDACTED] (4); TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING NEXT TRAUCHE OF DISCOVERY RELATED TO GENTING CLAIMS AND RESPONSES TO OBJECTIONS TO SAME (.6); REVIEW [REDACTED] (1.3); TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING FILING OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTIONS AND OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO SAME (.3);	2.60
08/12/25	SJC	REVIEW AND ANALYZE RESPONSES TO REQUEST FOR ADMISSION AND INTERROGATORIES FROM GENTING (.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING GENTING LITIGATION STRATEGY AND RELATED MATTERS (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ESI TEAM REGARDING DISCOVERY MATTERS (.3)	1.60
08/12/25	HJG	CONTINUE REVIEWING DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY GENTING LIQUIDATORS [REDACTED] (2.1); FURTHER REVISE AND SUPPLEMENT SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTIONS (0.8)	2.90
08/13/25	IMH	ANALYSIS OF GENTING'S OBJECTIONS TO INTERROGATORIES AND TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING NEXT STEPS	2.40
08/13/25	SJC	MEETINGS AND OTHER COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING GENTING RESPONSES TO REQUEST FOR ADMISSION AND INTERROGATORIES AND	1.30

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	
		CONTINUE REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF SAME		
08/13/25	HJG	REVIEW AND PREPARE AN ANALYSIS OF THE GENTING LIQUIDATORS' RESPONSES TO THE ASSIGNEE'S FIRST SET OF INTERROGATORIES AND FIRST REQUEST FOR ADMISSIONS (2.3); REVISE AND SUPPLEMENT MOTIONS FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT TO INCORPORATE THE GENTING LIQUIDATORS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES (3.5); STRATEGIZE REGARDING [REDACTED] (0.5)	6.30	
08/13/25	MH	CONDUCT QC OF MIGRATED RELATIVITY WORKSPACE; PREPARE EMAIL TO CASE TEAM RE: COMPLETION OF MIGRATION OF DATABASE FROM IPRO TO RELATIVITY; PREPARE EMAIL TO IT DEPT. RE: UPDATED BILLING; UPDATE TRACKING CHART RE: MIGRATION QC. [.5 NO CHARGE]	0.00	N/C
08/14/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING GENTING LITIGATION STRATEGY (.3); ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RELATED TO [REDACTED] (.8); FOLLOW UP RESEARCH REGARDING [REDACTED] (1.1)	2.20	
08/14/25	KW	REVIEW AND ASSESS GENTING RESPONSES TO INTERROGATORIES AND REQUEST FOR ADMISSIONS, AND PREPARE INTERNAL EMAIL MEMO RE RECOMMENDED FOLLOW UP	1.00	
08/14/25	SJC	MEETINGS AND CONFERENCES WITH TEAM REGARDING GENTING DISCOVERY RESPONSES, MEET AND CONFER, AND RELATED MATTERS	1.00	
08/14/25	HJG	FURTHER STRATEGIZE REGARDING [REDACTED] (0.5); CONTINUE REVIEWING DOCUMENTS AND SUPPLEMENTING MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED] (4.3); BEGIN DRAFTING CONFERRAL LETTER (0.5)	5.30	
08/15/25	IMH	COMMUNICATE WITH ESI TEAM REGARDING GENTING DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND FOLLOW UP WITH TEAM REGARDING NEXT STEPS	0.40	
08/15/25	KW	REVIEW REVISED PROPOSED DISCOVERY DEFICIENCY LETTER	0.30	
08/15/25	KW	FURTHER REVIEW AND ASSESS DISCOVERY STATUS, STRATEGY MATTERS	0.30	
08/15/25	KW	[REDACTED]	0.90	

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	
08/15/25	SJC	REVIEW DISCOVERY MEET AND CONFER LETTER AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME AND SEND SAME	0.50	
08/15/25	HJG	COMPLETE INITIAL DRAFT OF MEET AND CONFER LETTER (2.6); REVISE AND SUPPLEMENT MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED] (0.8)	3.40	
08/18/25	IMH	STRATEGIZE REGARDING REMAINING DEPOSITIONS IN GENTING LITIGATION (.3); PREPARE MATERIALS FOR COURT FOR NEXT CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.7); STRATEGIZE REGARDING [REDACTED] (.7)	1.70	
08/18/25	SJC	MEETINGS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING GENTING DISCOVERY MATTERS	0.20	
08/19/25	PSS	INTER OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH H. GRASSO RE DEBRIEF OF DEPOSITION OF FORMER CRYSTAL EMPLOYEE.	0.20	
08/19/25	SJC	MEETING WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING CREDITOR CLAIM OBJECTIONS, GENTING LITIGATION, AND OTHER CASE MATTERS	0.60	
08/19/25	HJG	REVISE AND SUPPLEMENT MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED]	1.60	
08/19/25	MH	COMPLETE QC OF MIGRATED MATTER - DISABLE IPRO DATABASE; PREPARE EMAIL TO CASE TEAM RE: COMPLETED MIGRATION; UPDATE MIGRATION QC SPREADSHEET. [.3 NO CHARGE]	0.00	N/C
08/20/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR MEET AND CONFER WITH GENTING AS TO ADMISSIONS (.8); TEAM EMAILS REGARDING [REDACTED] (.3)	1.10	
08/20/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING MONEYSHOW DISPUTE (.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING MEET AND CONFER AND DISCOVERY (.2)	0.70	
08/21/25	IMH	DISCUSSIONS AND EMAILS REGARDING [REDACTED] (.4); FOLLOW UP REGARDING NEXT WEEK'S CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.2)	0.60	
08/21/25	KW	INITIALLY REVIEW DRAFT MSJ RE [REDACTED]	0.60	
08/21/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SJS AND BEGIN TO REVIEW DRAFTS OF SAME	0.90	
08/21/25	HJG	REVISE AND FINALIZE INITIAL DRAFTS OF	2.40	

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		SUBSTANTIVE MOTIONS FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT	
08/22/25	KW	CONTINUE REVIEW AND ANALYSIS RE DRAFT MSJ MOTIONS	0.60
08/25/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO THIS WEEK'S CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.3); REVIEW MOTIONS FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND [REDACTED] (1.9); ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO PROFESSIONAL MONTHLY STATEMENTS AND FEE APPLICATIONS (.5); REVIEW GENTING SCHEDULING ORDER AS IT RELATES TO EXPERTS (.1);	2.80
08/25/25	KW	REVIEW DRAFT MOTIONS FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND DRAFT/REVISE INTRO AND STATEMENTS OF UNDISPUTED FACT [REDACTED]	2.80
08/25/25	KW	REVIEW GENTING "REBUTTAL" EXPERT DISCLOSURE AND [REDACTED]	0.50
08/26/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS THROUGHOUT THE DAY AND RESEARCH REGARDING [REDACTED] (.9); TEAM STRATEGY SESSION REGARDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTIONS AGAINST GENTING AND REVIEW CHANGES TO SAME [REDACTED] (.9);	2.80
08/26/25	CC	FINALIZE AND E-FILE MOTION TO STRIKE EXPERT DISCLOSURE.	0.30
08/26/25	KW	CONTINUE WORK ON MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT [0.5]; CONFER WITH LEGAL TEAM RE [REDACTED] [0.7]	1.20
08/26/25	KW	REVIEW/REVISE OUTLINE FOR CMC ARGUMENT REGARDING [REDACTED]	0.80
08/26/25	SJC	REVIEW EXPERT DISCLOSURE FILED BY GENTING, PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME AND RESPONSE, RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH SAME, REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO STRIKE SAME, AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (2.0); PREPARE FOR CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.6)	2.60
08/26/25	HJG	ANALYSIS AND RESEARCH REGARDING [REDACTED] (2.3); DRAFT STATEMENT OF FACTS FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT	9.20

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		MOTION (4.6); STRATEGIZE REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (0.4); DRAFT [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (1.9)	
08/27/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO MEET AND CONFER FOR [REDACTED] (.3); DEBRIEF WITH TEAM REGARDING TODAY'S CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND NEXT STEPS IN GENTING LITIGATION INCLUDING [REDACTED] (.8); STRATEGIZE AND PREPARE MATERIALS IN SUPPORT OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTIONS (2.0)	3.10
08/27/25	KW	APPEAR FOR CMC RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30
08/27/25	KW	REVIEW/REVISE UPDATED DRAFT OF MSJ	0.70
08/27/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND MEETINGS AND CONFERENCES WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME, EXPERT MATTERS, AND OTHER CASE MATTERS (1.6); CONFERENCE WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING CMC, SJS, EXPERT MATTERS, AND OTHER CASE MATTERS (.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR COUNSEL REGARDING CMC AND CASE STATUS (.2)	2.30
08/27/25	HJG	CONTINUE DRAFTING STATEMENT OF UNDISPUTED FACTS (2.6); COMBINE MOTIONS FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND REVISE FURTHER (3.4)	6.00
08/28/25	IMH	ANALYSIS RELATED TO GENTING MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (1.2); ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO TODAY'S MEET AND CONFER ON INTERROGATORY ANSWERS IN GENTING LITIGATION (.5); PREPARE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.8); PREPARE MEMO FOR REDACTION OF INVOICES FOR COUNSEL TO ASSIGNEE (.3); REVIEW BACK UP RELATED TO SAME (.6);	3.40
08/28/25	KW	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERRAL CALL WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING DISCOVERY AND LATE DISCLOSED EXPERT (0.8); DEBRIEF WITH LEGAL TEAM TO CONFIRM STRATEGY ON [REDACTED] AND RE UPCOMING KEY DEPOSITIONS (0.5)	1.30
08/28/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEET AND CONFER SESSION WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING VARIOUS DISCOVERY MATTERS, EXPERTS, AND DEPOSITIONS, AND RELATED CONFERENCES AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND	1.80

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING SAME AND RELATED MATTERS	
08/28/25	HJG	REVIEW AND IDENTIFY ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS TO SUPPORT SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTIONS (3.3); CONFERRAL CALL REGARDING DISCOVERY MATTERS AND EXPERT WITNESS (0.7)	4.00
08/29/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR DEPOSITIONS OF HOPPE AND CELORIO (.8); ANALYSIS REGARDING [REDACTED] (1.4); PREPARE FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE GENTING'S EXPERT (.4)	2.60
08/29/25	KW	ANALYSIS OF STRATEGY RE [REDACTED]	0.50
08/29/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS AND STRATEGY RE HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE GENTING'S LATE EXPERT DISCLOSURE	0.30
08/29/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING EXPERT MATTERS, MEET AND CONFER, MOTION TO STRIKE, DEPOSITIONS, AND OTHER CASE MATTERS (.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SJS AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS (.8)	1.70
08/29/25	HJG	INVESTIGATE AND ANALYZE [REDACTED]	4.70
08/30/25	IMH	ANALYSIS OF GENTING'S CLAIMS AGAINST THE ESTATE AND [REDACTED] (1.9); REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING STRATEGY ON MOTION TO STRIKE (.4)	2.30
08/30/25	KW	CONTINUE REVIEW AND ANALYSIS RE UPDATED MSJ	0.70
08/30/25	KW	FURTHER ANALYSIS REGARDING [REDACTED]	0.30
09/01/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR NEXT WEEK'S DEPOSITIONS IN GENTING LITIGATION	2.50
09/02/25	IMH	RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS REGARDING [REDACTED] (2.2); REVIEW INVOICES RELATED TO REDACTION ISSUES FOR SUBMISSION TO THE COURT (.7); TEAM DISCUSSIONS REGARDING UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS AND TRIAL STRATEGY (.2)	3.10
09/02/25	CC	REVIEW WIP FOR NEXT INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF BSLLP.	1.00
09/02/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS RE PREPARATIONS FOR CELORIO DEPOSITION	0.40

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
09/02/25	SJC	CONFERENCE CALLS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING, ASSIGNEE, AND TEAM REGARDING EXPERT MATTERS, MOTION TO STRIKE, SCHEDULING ORDER, DEPOSITIONS, AND VARIOUS RELATED MATTERS (1.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.2); MEETINGS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SJ PREPARATION AND EXHIBITS (.8)	2.10
09/03/25	IMH	EMAILS WITH GENTING'S COUNSEL REGARDING HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE AND EXTENSION OF DATES IN PRETRIAL ORDER (.2); STRATEGIZE WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.4); FOLLOW UP REGARDING PENDING AND OPEN CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.2); ATTN TO ISSUES REGARDING REDACTION ON FEE APPLICATIONS FOR ASSIGNEE PROFESSIONALS (.4); ANALYSIS RELATED TO ██████████ (4); STRATEGIZE REGARDING MOTION TO AMEND CASE MANAGEMENT ORDER AND REVIEW GENTING'S MEMORANDUM REGARDING SAME (.8)	2.40
09/03/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS AND UPDATE STRATEGY REGARDING SCHEDULING ISSUES, INCLUDING INITIAL REVIEW OF GENTING MOTION TO AMEND CASE MANAGEMENT ORDER	0.50
09/03/25	KW	FURTHER ANALYSIS REGARDING ██████████	0.30
09/03/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTIONS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND TEAM REGARDING DEPOSITION SCHEDULING, EXPERT MATTERS, AND OTHER MATTERS (.7); REVIEW AND ANALYZE MOTION TO MODIFY SCHEDULING ORDER AND RESEARCH REGARDING SAME AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME AND RESPONSE (1.0)	1.90
09/03/25	HJG	██████████	4.70
09/04/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES REGARDING UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS INCLUDING REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS, EMAILS AND TEAM DISCUSSIONS (2.2); TEAM DISCUSSIONS THROUGHOUT THE DAY AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO GENTING'S MOTION TO AMEND CASE MANAGEMENT ORDER, ASSIGNEE'S MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND TO STRIKE EXPERT (1.3); MEETING WITH S CAPUANO, K WATERWAY AND H GRASSO TO DISCUSS PRETRIAL STRATEGY AND OPEN ISSUES (.8);	4.30

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
09/04/25	CC	CONTINUE REVIEW WIP FOR TIME FROM 5.1.2025 THROUGH 8.31.2025 IN PREPARATION OF NEXT INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	1.20
09/04/25	CC	OBTAIN AND REVIEW JUDGE WALSH'S PRETRIAL SCHEDULING ORDER AND REDLINE AGAINST SCHEDULING ORDER ENTERED IN OUR CASE (.40); CONFER WITH I. HOMER RE SAME (.20).	0.60
09/04/25	KW	PREPARE FOR CELORIO DEPOSITION, INCLUDING REVIEW OF [REDACTED]	1.40
09/04/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS AND UPDATE STRATEGY W/ LEGAL TEAM RE DEPOSITIONS, GENTING MOTION TO AMEND CMO	0.80
09/04/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH TEAM REGARDING GENTING LITIGATION, DEPOSITIONS, SUMMARY JUDGMENT, MOTION TO MODIFY SCHEDULING ORDER, MOTION TO STRIKE, AND VARIOUS RELATED MATTERS (1.0); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING DEPOSITION SCHEDULING AND RELATED MATTERS (.2); WORK ON DEPOSITION PREPARATION FOR R CELORIO (.3); WORK ON RESPONSE TO MOTION TO AMEND SCHEDULING ORDER AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.7)	2.20
09/04/25	HJG	DRAFT RESPONSE TO MOTION TO MODIFY CASE MANAGEMENT ORDER 3.1); BEGIN PREPARING FOR R. CELORIO DEPOSITION (2.0)	5.10
09/05/25	IMH	TEAM DISCUSSIONS THROUGHOUT THE DAY AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING PREPARATION FOR CELORIO DEPOSITION (2.2); ANALYSIS IN SUPPORT OF MEMORANDUM IN OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO MODIFY CASE MANAGEMENT ORDER (.7); REVIEW CURRENT DRAFT OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION (.5)	3.40
09/05/25	KW	CONTINUE PREPARATION FOR CELORIO DEPOSITION (1.5); REVIEW/REVISE DRAFT RESPONSE TO GENTING MOTION TO AMEND CASE MANAGEMENT ORDER (1.5)	3.00
09/05/25	SJC	REVIEW RESPONSE TO MOTION TO STRIKE AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.6); REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO MOTION TO MODIFY SCHEDULING ORDER AND VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME, AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND CORRESPONDENCE IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (.8); REVIEW RENOTICE OF DEPOSITION OF R CELORIO AND	2.80

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		COMMUNICATIONS WITH GENTING COUNSEL AND TEAM REGARDING DEPOSITION SCHEDULING (.3); WORK ON DEPOSITION PREPARATION FOR R CELORIO AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.1)	
09/05/25	HJG	CONTINUE PREPARING FOR R. CELORIO DEPOSITION (1.0); CONTINUE DRAFTING OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO AMEND CASE MANAGEMENT ORDER (0.9)	1.90
09/06/25	IMH	ANALYSIS IN SUPPORT OF REPLY TO OPPOSITION TO ASSIGNEE'S MOTION TO STRIKE (.8); FOLLOW UP WITH TEAM REGARDING SPECIAL SET HEARING ON SAME AND ON EXPERT ISSUES (.2)	1.00
09/06/25	KW	CONTINUE PREPARATION FOR CELORIO DEPOSITION	0.70
09/08/25	IMH	DISCUSSIONS AND ANALYSIS REGARDING CELORIO DEPOSITION (1); DEBRIEF WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.2); STRATEGIZE AND PREPARE FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE AND MOTION IN OPPOSITION TO EXTENSION OF DEADLINES IN AND MODIFICATION TO SCHEDULING ORDER (1.8); PREPARE FOR HANDS ON CALL WITH ASSIGNEE AND COUNSEL (.3); DISCUSS STATUS AND OPEN ISSUES WITH TEAM (.2)	3.50
09/08/25	KW	CONTINUE REVIEW AND PREP FOR R. CELORIO DEPOSITION [1.0], AND ATTEND/PARTICIPATE IN DEPOSITION [5.5]	6.50
09/08/25	SJC	CONFERENCES AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING DEPOSITION OF R CELORIO, SJS, OTHER CLAIM ISSUES, AND OTHER CASE MATTERS (1.3); REVIEW REVISED RESPONSE TO MOTION MODIFY SCHEDULING ORDER AND WORK ON SAME AND EXHIBIT AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (.6)	1.90
09/08/25	HJG	REVISE OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO AMEND TRIAL ORDER (0.6); PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND DEPOSITION OF R. CELORIO (7.2)	7.80
09/09/25	IMH	STRATEGIZE WITH TEAM REGARDING STATUS OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES IN GENTING (.2); EMAILS AND ANALYSIS RELATED TO HEARING PREP ON THE MOTION TO STRIKE EXPERT (.4); REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASES CITED BY GENTING IN ITS MOTION TO MODIFY SCHEDULING ORDER (.4)	1.00
09/09/25	CC	FINALIZE AND E-FILE RESPONSE TO GENTING'S MOTION TO AMENDED CASE MANAGEMENT/SCHEDULING ORDER.	0.40
09/09/25	KW	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE W/ GENTING COUNSEL RE	0.20

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		DEPOSITION OF HOPPE	
09/09/25	KW	REVIEW PILLSBURY EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO COURT REGARDING CMO / EXPERT ISSUES AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING RESPONSE (0.5); EMAIL CORRESP W/ PILLSBURY RE CELORIO DEPOSITION EXHIBITS AND REVIEW/CONFIRM EXHIBITS (0.4)	0.90
09/09/25	SJC	FINALIZE AND FILE RESPONSE TO MOTION TO MODIFY SCHEDULING ORDER AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND CHAMBERS REGARDING SAME (.8); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING CELORIO DEPOSITION AND HOPPE DEPOSITION (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING AND TEAM REGARDING DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (.3)	1.70
09/09/25	HJG	SUPPLEMENT MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND STATEMENT OF UNDISPUTED FACTS (2.8); CORRESPOND WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING DISCOVERY MATTERS (.3); PROVIDE SUMMARY AND UPDATE REGARDING DEPOSITION TO M. HEALY (.2)	3.30
09/10/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS RE PENDING ITEMS PER DISCOVERY MEET/CONFER, HEARING ON EXPERT MOTIONS	0.40
09/10/25	SJC	WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION INCLUDING LEGAL AND FACTUAL RESEARCH AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (2.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING, TEAM, AND CHAMBERS REGARDING MOTION TO STRIKE, MOTION TO MODIFY SCHEDULING ORDER, AND HEARINGS ON SAME (.7)	2.90
09/11/25	IMH	FOLLOW UP REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.3); ANALYSIS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH DISCOVERY TEAM REGARDING [REDACTED] (1.2); ADDITIONAL REDACTIONS IN BERGER SINGERMAN INVOICES RELATIVE TO GENTING STRATEGY (.5); PREPARE FOR UPCOMING CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.2)	2.20
09/11/25	SJC	CONTINUE WORKING ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION INCLUDING LEGAL RESEARCH AND EXHIBITS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.8); COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING DISCOVERY FROM GENTING, DEPOSITION PREPARATION, AND RELATED MATTERS (.6)	2.40
09/11/25	HJG	COMPILE EXHIBITS FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT	1.20

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		MOTION	
09/12/25	IMH	REVIEW POTENTIAL ADDITIONAL EXHIBITS FOR GENTING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION (2); PREPARE FOR CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE INCLUDING PRESENTATION ON PENDING MOTIONS (1.5);	3.50
09/12/25	SJC	CONTINUE WORKING ON MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND STATEMENT OF FACTS, AS WELL AS EXHIBITS, AND LEGAL AND FACTUAL RESEARCH REGARDING SAME, AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME (4.8); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING EXPERT MATTERS AND RELATED MATTERS (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING CASE STATUS (.2)	5.60
09/12/25	HJG	ANALYZE ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS FOR USE IN SUPPORT OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT	1.70
09/13/25	IMH	FOLLOW UP WITH EDISCOVERY TEAM REGARDING [REDACTED] AND REVIEW UPDATED DRAFT OF SAME	0.50
09/14/25	KW	FURTHER REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF UPDATED [REDACTED]	0.50
09/15/25	IMH	REVIEW MATERIALS NEEDED TO PROVIDE M HEALY IN CONNECTION WITH SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION AGAINST GENTING (2); ANALYSIS OF CASES AND MATERIALS RELEVANT TO UPCOMING CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (1.2)	3.20
09/15/25	KW	REVIEW CELORIO DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT AND EXHIBITS (0.2); BEGIN REVIEW OF UPDATED MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT (0.4)	0.60
09/15/25	SJC	CONTINUE WORKING ON MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND STATEMENT OF FACTS, AND FACTUAL AND LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING SAME, AND CIRCULATE DRAFT TO TEAM	7.80
09/15/25	HJG	SUPPLEMENT SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION WITH [REDACTED]	1.70
09/16/25	IMH	RESEARCH AND ATTENTION TO OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO FINALIZING GENTING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION (2.4); TEAM EMAILS REGARDING UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS RELATED TO GENTING CLAIMS (.2)	2.60
09/16/25	KW	REVIEW FOR STATUS RE PREPARATION FOR HOPPE DEPOSITION AND, MOTION TO EXTEND DISCOVERY	0.40

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		FOR LIMITED PURPOSE OF DEPOSITION	
09/16/25	SJC	CONTINUE WORKING ON MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND STATEMENT OF FACTS AND RELATED EXHIBITS, AND LEGAL AND FACTUAL RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH SAME, AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (3.0); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING OTHER MATTERS RELATED TO GENTING OBJECTION AND TRIAL PREPARATION (.7); REVIEW DRAFT MOTION TO EXTEND DEADLINE TO DEPOSE J HOPPE AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND GENTING COUNSEL REGARDING SAME, AND REVIEW NOTICE OF DEPOSITION (.6);	4.30
09/16/25	HJG	REVISE MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND STATEMENT OF FACTS (5.7); BEGIN PREPARING FOR DEPOSITION OF J. HOPPE (1.3)	7.00
09/17/25	IMH	REVIEW CLAIMANTS' REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO AMEND CASE MANAGEMENT SCHEDULE AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING RESPONSE/ORAL ARGUMENT TO OPPOSE SAME (.4); PREPARE FOR HEARING ON SAME (.8); DISCUSS OPEN ISSUES IN SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED] (2); REVIEW DATABASES TO OBTAIN DOCUMENTS [REDACTED] (3)	2.40
09/17/25	CC	REVIEW INVOICES IN PREPARATION OF NEXT INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF BSLLP.	0.60
09/17/25	KW	REVIEW EMAIL CORRESP RE ADDITIONAL CONFERRAL ON CONTINUING DISCOVERY ISSUES	0.20
09/17/25	SJC	CONTINUE REVISING MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND STATEMENT OF FACTS, AND LEGAL AND FACTUAL RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH SAME, COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME, AND FINALIZE AND CIRCULATE SAME TO ASSIGNEE (2.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING OTHER DISPOSITIVE MOTION ISSUES (.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING, CHAMBERS, AND TEAM REGARDING HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE EXPERT AND REVIEW REPLY REGARDING MOTION TO MODIFY BRIEFING SCHEDULE (.7)	3.30
09/17/25	HJG	ANALYZE MATTERS RELATING TO [REDACTED] (2.9); PREPARE OUTLINE OF QUESTIONS FOR DEPOSITION OF J. HOPPE (1.6)	4.50
09/18/25	IMH	REVIEW COURT PROCEDURES REGARDING	2.10

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		UPCOMING HEARINGS (.2); TEAM EMAILS REGARDING NEXT HEARING ON PROFESSIONAL FEE APPLICATIONS (.2); ATTN TO ISSUES RELATED TO REDACTION OF SAME (.2); ANALYSIS RELATED TO [REDACTED] INCLUDING TEAM DEBRIEF OF GENTING CALL REGARDING SAME AND FOLLOW UP EMAILS (1.5)	
09/18/25	KW	CALL WITH GENTING COUNSEL REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES AND THEIR DISCLOSURE OF INTENTION TO AMEND (REDUCE) CERTAIN CLAIMS (0.5); UPDATE STATUS/STRATEGY RE MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT (0.5); CONTINUE PREP FOR HOPPE DEPOSITION (1.0)	2.00
09/18/25	SJC	CONFERENCE CALLS AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING DISPOSITIVE MOTION ISSUES IN GENTING LITIGATION, REVISIONS TO SJ, AND RELATED MATTERS (1.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING [REDACTED] (.3)	1.60
09/18/25	HJG	CONFERRAL CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR CLAIMANTS (0.4); REVISE STATEMENT OF FACTS AND MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT (2.8); REVISE MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT [REDACTED] (1.0); STRATEGIZE REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES AND DISPOSITIVE MOTIONS (0.3)	4.60
09/19/25	IMH	PREPARE FOR CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.3); ATTN TO ISSUES REGARDING HOPPE DEPOSITION (2); FOLLOW UP WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING DOCUMENTS RELATED TO [REDACTED] (.2);	2.50
09/19/25	KW	COMPLETE PREPARATION FOR AND ATTEND DEPOSITION OF JESSICA HOPPE	2.50
09/19/25	KW	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE W/ LEGAL TEAM RE UPDATED MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT STRATEGY (.20); REVIEW UPDATED DRAFT (.40)	0.60
09/19/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING J HOPPE DEPOSITION AND SUMMARY JUDGMENT ISSUES	0.60
09/19/25	HJG	STRATEGIZE REGARDING [REDACTED] (1.3); ATTEND DEPOSITION OF J. HOPPE (1.9)	3.20
09/22/25	IMH	TEAM EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS REGARDING [REDACTED] (.2); REVIEW SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION TO [REDACTED] (.9); TEAM CALLS REGARDING SAME (.4); STRATEGIZE REGARDING FEE	3.10

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		APPLICATION FOR ASSIGNEE PROFESSIONALS (.4); ATTN TO ISSUES REGARDING REDACTION OF SAME (1.2);	
09/22/25	KW	REVIEW MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT STATUS/STRATEGY WITH LEGAL TEAM	0.50
09/22/25	KW	REVIEW/CONFIRM HOPPE DEP TRANSCRIPT AND EXHIBITS	0.20
09/22/25	SJC	CONTINUE WORKING ON MSJ, AND PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH TEAM REGARDING SJS, AND FURTHER COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM REGARDING FINALIZING SAME (1.8); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE AND TEAM AND COCOUNSEL REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING GENERAL CASE STATUS AND CLAIMS ISSUES (.3)	2.40
09/22/25	HJG	CONTINUE REVISING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTIONS (6.8); STRATEGIZE IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (1.0)	7.80
09/23/25	IMH	STRATEGIZE REGARDING TOMORROW'S CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE	0.30
09/23/25	KW	BEGIN REVIEW OF UPDATED DRAFT MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND STATEMENT OF FACTS	0.70
09/23/25	SJC	COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND CHAMBERS REGARDING HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE AND TO MODIFY CASE MANAGEMENT SCHEDULE (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION AND CONTINUE WORKING ON SAME (.7); REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS (1.1)	2.10
09/23/25	HJG	CONTINUE REVISING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION AND STATEMENT OF FACTS	6.50
09/24/25	IMH	TEAM EMAILS AND DEBRIEF OF TODAY'S CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE (.2); DISCUSS STRATEGY [REDACTED] (.5);	0.70
09/24/25	KW	CONTINUE REVIEW AND ANALYSIS REGARDING [REDACTED]	0.50
09/24/25	KW	REVIEW DRAFT MOTION/ORDER FOR EXCEEDING PAGE LIMIT ON LENGTHY MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT	0.20
09/24/25	SJC	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CASE MANAGEMENT	4.80

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
		CONFERENCE AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CHAMBERS AND TEAM REGARDING MOTION TO STRIKE (.2); CONTINUE REVISING SJ MOTION AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME, STATEMENT OF FACTS, DECLARATION, EXHIBITS, MOTION TO EXTEND PAGE LIMIT, AND RELATED MATTERS (2.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR CREDITORS REGARDING CMC, STATUS AND CLAIMS (.4);	
09/24/25	JR	COMMUNICATION AND STRATEGY RE EXPORT OF NATIVE PRODUCTION DOCUMENTS FOR USE AS EXHIBITS.	0.40
09/24/25	HJG	DRAFT MOTION FOR LEAVE AND PROPOSED ORDER (1.5); STRATEGIZE [REDACTED] (1.2); CONTINUE REVISING, SUPPLEMENTING, AND FINALIZING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION AND STATEMENT OF FACTS (6.6)	9.30
09/24/25	MH	EXPORT/BRAND PRODUCTION DOCUMENTS FOR USE AT DEPOSITION.	0.50
09/25/25	IMH	REVIEW EVIDENCE IN SUPPORT OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND STRATEGIZE REGARDING SAME	2.80
09/25/25	SJC	MEETINGS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SJ, DECLARATION, EXHIBITS, AND RELATED PAPERS AND CONTINUE WORKING ON SAME, AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR GENTING REGARDING SAME AND RELATED MATTERS	3.50
09/25/25	HJG	DRAFT DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT (1.6); FURTHER REVISE MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT (1.8)	3.40
09/26/25	IMH	ATTN TO ISSUES THROUGHOUT THE DAY REGARDING FINALIZING GENTING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION, INCLUDING EXHIBITS AND PREPARE FOR HEARING ON SAME	2.20
09/26/25	KW	REVIEW FINAL DRAFT OF MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT FILINGS	0.30
09/26/25	KW	INITIALLY REVIEW AND ASSESS LYS EXPERT REPORT	0.60
09/26/25	SJC	CONTINUE WORKING ON, FINALIZE, AND FILE MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT, DECLARATION IN SUPPORT, EXHIBITS, AND MOTION TO EXTEND PAGE LIMIT AND PROPOSED ORDER, AND VARIOUS CONFERENCES AND EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND ASSIGNEE REGARDING SAME	5.80

F E E S

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/26/25	HJG	FINALIZE MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT, EXHIBITS, NOTICE OF FILING, AND DECLARATION	4.60
09/27/25	KW	CONTINUE REVIEW AND ASSESS LYS EXPERT REPORT	0.30
09/29/25	IMH	REVIEW [REDACTED] AND DISCUSS STRATEGY FOR SAME (1.5); TEAM [REDACTED] REVIEW CASE LAW IN SUPPORT OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT HEARING (1.6)	3.90
09/29/25	KW	CONTINUE ATTENTION TO ASSESSING AND STRATEGIC RESPONSE TO GENTING EXPERT DISCLOSURE / LYS REPORT	1.00
09/29/25	SJC	REVIEW AND ANALYZE EXPERT REPORT FROM GENTING, AND VARIOUS MEETINGS, CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME, AND [REDACTED], AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH GENTING COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (4.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITOR REGARDING STATUS OF GENTING LITIGATION (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING EXPERT MATTERS (.2)	4.50
09/29/25	HJG	ANALYZE EXPERT REPORT AND CONDUCT RELATED RESEARCH	4.60
09/30/25	PSS	STRATEGY SESSION WITH S. CAPUANO, I HOMER AND H. GRASSO RE [REDACTED]	0.30
09/30/25	IMH	ANALYSIS OF CASES TO SUPPORT ORAL ARGUMENT ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND [REDACTED] (2.4); REVIEW INVOICES TO BE REDACTED IN SUPPORT OF BERGER SINGERMAN FEE APPLICATION (.8)	3.20
09/30/25	CC	PREPARE MOTION FOR PAYMENT OF ATTORNEYS' FEES AND EXPENSES OF BSLLP.	1.00
09/30/25	KW	FURTHER ANALYZE STRATEGY REGARDING GENTING EXPERT DISCLOSURE AND RESPONSE, [REDACTED]	0.50
09/30/25	SJC	CONFERENCE WITH ASSIGNEE REGARDING EXPERT MATTERS AND MEETINGS AND OTHER COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM REGARDING SAME, AND RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (2.0); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TEAM AND COCOUNSEL REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.3)	2.30
09/30/25	HJG	RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS REGARDING [REDACTED] (4.1); BEGIN [REDACTED]	8.60

F E E S

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours
			(4.5)
Total Hours:			831.00
Total Fees:			544,551.50

F E E S U M M A R Y

Attorney	Hours	Rate	Total
Paul Avron	1.40	800.00	1,120.00
Kerry L. Burns	0.60	425.00	255.00
Samuel J. Capuano	238.70	700.00	167,090.00
Carmen Cruz	24.00	425.00	10,200.00
Janette Diaz	3.80	425.00	1,615.00
Charles M. Gantz	21.70	385.00	8,354.50
Hunter J. Grasso	256.10	525.00	134,452.50
Mary Joann Hill	12.70	425.00	5,397.50
Ilyse M. Homer	195.00	810.00	157,950.00
Jesse Richman	7.80	465.00	3,627.00
Paul S. Singerman	1.20	925.00	1,110.00
Kenneth W. Waterway	68.00	785.00	53,380.00
Total	831.00		\$544,551.50

E X P E N S E S

Date	Description	Amount
07/09/25	VENDOR: OUELLETTE & MAULDIN COURT REPORTERS, INC; INVOICE#: 977249; DATE: 7/9/2025 - 30806.0001 DEPOSITION OF: FOOK YWE AU A/K/A COLIN AU - VIA ZOOM VIDEOCONFERENCE - ATTENDANCE OF REPORTER; O & 1 - 118 THREE DAY DELIVERY; LITIGATION PACKAGE	1,558.80
07/23/25	VENDOR: WATERWAY, KENNETH INVOICE#: 2619760864 DATE: 7/31/2025 7/23/2025 - PARKING AT IN-PERSON HEARING AT MIAMI COURTHOUSE. - THANK YOU - OFFICE: FTL	22.60
07/24/25	VENDOR: CAPUANO, SAMUEL J. INVOICE#: 2681760844 DATE: 7/30/2025 7/24/2025 - 54 W FLAGER ST PARKING - ATTEND HEARING - OFFICE: MIA	40.00

EXPENSES

Date	Description	Amount
07/25/25	VENDOR: OUELLETTE & MAULDIN COURT REPORTERS, INC; INVOICE#: 977327; DATE: 7/25/2025 - 30806.0001 HEARING BEFORE HON. LISA WALSH - ATTENDANCE OF REPORTER; ONE COPY, 38 PAGES	330.50
08/24/25	VENDOR: HOMER, ILYSE M. INVOICE#: 0923261475 DATE: 8/31/2025 8/24/2025 - AMERICAN AIRLINE - WIFI - OFFICE: MIA	24.00
09/15/25	VENDOR: VERITEXT; INVOICE#: 8631324; DATE: 9/15/2025 - 30806.0001 WITNESS: RICARDO CELORIO - TRANSCRIPT SERVICES - CERTIFIED TRANSCRIPT; EXHIBITS; VERITEXT EXHIBIT PACKAGE (ACE); SECURE HOSTING & DELIVERY OF VERITEXT FILE SUITE	1,241.75
09/15/25	VENDOR: VERITEXT; INVOICE#: 8634483; DATE: 9/15/2025 - 30806.0001 WITNESS: JUDGE L. WALSH - TRANSCRIPT SERVICES-CERTIFIED TRANSCRIPT ADVANCED PROCEEDING; SECURE HOSTING & DELIVERY OF VERITEXT FILE SUITE	185.90
09/23/25	VENDOR: VERITEXT; INVOICE#: 8654671; DATE: 9/23/2025 - 30806.0001 WITNESS: JESSICA HOPPE - TRANSCRIPT SERVICES; EXHIBITS; LOGISTICS, PROCESSING & ELECTRONIC FILES	525.25
	E-DISCOVERY DATA STORAGE FEE (\$12 PER GB)	65,726.04
	PACER CHARGE	1.10
	REPRODUCTION	106.95
	WESTLAW CHARGES	4,271.92
Total Expenses		\$74,034.81
CURRENT BALANCE DUE		\$618,586.31

EXHIBIT B
(Proposed Order)

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE 11TH
JUDICIAL CIRCUIT IN AND FOR
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

In re:

COMPLEX BUSINESS LITIGATION
DIVISION

CRYSTAL CRUISES LLC, a California
limited liability company,

Case No. 2022-002742-CA-01
Lead Case

CRYSTAL HOLDINGS U.S., LLC, a
Delaware limited liability company,

Case No. 2022-002757-CA-01

CRYSTAL AIRCRUISES, LLC, a Florida
limited liability company, and

Case No. 2022-002758-CA-01

Assignors,
To:

(Jointly Administered Cases)

MARK C. HEALY,

Assignee.

**ORDER GRANTING MOTION FOR APPROVAL AND PAYMENT
OF FEES AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED
BY BERGER SINGERMAN LLP AS COUNSEL TO THE ASSIGNEE
FOR THE PERIOD MAY 1, 2025 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2025 [DE ____]**

THIS CAUSE came before the Court upon the *Motion for Approval and Payment of Fees and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred by Berger Singerman LLP as Counsel to the Assignee for the Period May 1, 2025 through September 30, 2025* [DE ____] (the “Motion”), filed on negative notice by Mark C. Healy (the “Assignee”) on October 7, 2025, solely in his capacity as the Assignee for the benefit of creditors of Crystal Cruises LLC, Crystal Holdings U.S. LLC, and Crystal AirCruises LLC (collectively, the “Assignors”), pursuant to which Berger Singerman LLP seeks compensation in the amount of \$544,551.50 and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$74,034.81, for a total award of \$618,586.31 for the period of May 1, 2025 through September 30, 2025. The Court, having considered the Motion and the record in this proceeding, noting that

no objection to the Motion was filed by any party, finding that notice of the Motion was sufficient, and good cause appearing, it is hereby

ORDERED that:

1. The Motion is **GRANTED**.
2. Berger Singerman, LLP, as counsel to the Assignee, is awarded fees in the amount of \$544,551.50 and expenses in the amount of \$74,034.81, for a total award of \$618,586.31, which represents 100% of the fees and expenses requested in the Motion.
3. The Assignee is authorized to pay to Berger Singerman LLP the sum of \$618,586.31.
4. In making the foregoing award, the Court finds that the amounts awarded represent reasonable compensation for actual and necessary services rendered and expenses incurred by Berger Singerman LLP for the benefit of the assignment estates.

DONE AND ORDERED in Chambers, at Miami-Dade County, Florida on this ___ day of October, 2025.

HONORABLE LISA S. WALSH
Circuit Court Judge

Copies furnished to:

Counsel of record